
KEONJHARGARH  BLOCK. 
  The  name  of  the  Block  is  Keonjhargarh  Block.  It  started  functioning  in  the year  

1955.  The  geographical  area  of  this  Block  is  297  Sqr.  Miles. The population  as  per  
2011  census  of  this  Block  is 162148  out  of  which  Male  Population  is  81305,  Female  
Population  is  80843,  ST   Population  is  81567SC  Population  is  16082 and  Others  are  
64499  no. The  literate  population of  this  Block  is  94723. Category  wise  the  population  
percentage  of  this Block  is  as  follows,  Male:-   50.14,  Female :-  49.86,  ST :-  50.3,  SC : 
09.9, Oth :-  39.8  and  literate   population  percentage  is  58.4.  The  total  Households  of  
this  Block  is  35963  no.  This  Block  consists  of  24  no.  of  GPs  in  which  there  are  231   
Revenue  villages  and  09  hamlets.  The  Block  has  01  no.  of  CHC ,  05  no.  of  New  
PHC, 02  no.  of  Govt.  Homeopathy  Dispensary,  30  no.  of  ANM   centers,  190  Asha  
centers,  261       no.  of  AW  centers,  198  no.  of  GKS  for  facilitation  of   better  health  
care  of  the  villagers.  For  education  regards  the   Block  has  141  no.  of  PS,  25  no.  of  
PUPS,  11  no.  of  NUPS,  21  no.  of  UPS,  17  no.  of  UGMES,  38  no.  of  High  Schools,  
03  no.  of  Degree   Colleges  and  02  no.  of  Degree  Engineering  Colleges.  The  Block  
provides  drinking  water  to  the  inhabitants through  1584  no.  of  Tube  Wells,  47   Wells  
and  25  no.  of  Piped  Water  System.  To  irrigate  its  agricultural  fields   the  Block  has  
03  MIPs.   36  no. of  Financial  Institutions  and  02  no.  of  LAMPS  are  functioning  in  the  
Block and  they  are  financing   the  villagers  in  respect  of  ISB,  Agriculture, Pisciculture  
and  all  sort  of  segments   including  credit  linkage  to  SHG  groups.  902   no.  of  Women  
Self  Help   Groups  are  functioning   under  the  guidance  of  this  Block.   To  provide  
better  treatment  to  the  Live Stocks  the  Block  has  02 no.  of   VAS  centre  and  18  no.  
of  LI  centers.The Block  has  29  no.  of  Weekly  Hats, 403  no.  of  Tank/Bandha,  14  no. 
Bagayat  and   47no.  of  Kaina houses  which  are  functioning  by  different GPs  of  the  
Block.  Alphabetically  the  name  of  the  GPs  are  Baradapal, Bauripada,  Bodapalasa,  
Dimbo,  Gobardhan,  Handibhanga,  Janardanpur,  Kandraposi,  Kathabari,  Kaunrikala, 
Mahadeijoda,  Maidankle,  Mandua, Naranpur,  Nelung,  Nuagaon,  Padampur,  Palasponga,  
Parjanpur,  Raghunathpur, Raikala,  Raisuan,  Sankiri   And  Sirispal. 

 
GP  PROFILE  
 
01. BARADAPAL  G.P  :- Baradapal  GP  hqr. is nearly  17 Kms  away  from  Block  hqr. 
This  GP  consists of  04  villages  and  11  Wards. The  GP  has  its  own  Office  Building,07  
nos.  of  GP  Tanks. The  population  of  the  GP  is 3959  out  of  which  the  ST  population  
is  3477 nos. Mainly  the  Pahadi  Bhuyan  Tribes  are  residing  in  this  GP.  Almost  all  the 
areas  are  hilly. The  villagers  are  depending  on  one  seasoned  cultivation  and  labor. 
This  GP  has  02  SSD  hostel, 06  no.  UPS,  01  no  High  School,  01  no  ANM  centre.  
07  nos.  AWC, Asha  Centre,  and  one  no.  of  New  PHC  for  Education  and  Health  care  
respectively. 
 
02. BAURIPADA  GP. :- Bauripada  GP  hqr. is  14  Kms.  away  from  Block  hqr.  The  
population of  the  GP  is 8355  out  of  which  the  ST Population  is  3620  nos. This  GP  
consists  of  11 nos.   villages and  18 nos. of  Wards. The  GP has its own  Office  building. 
The  GP  has  34 nos. of  GP Tanks. Mainly  the villagers  are  cultivators  and  agricultural  
laborers.  This  GP  has  02  no.  of  SSD  hostel,  10  nos.  of  UPS  one  no.  of  High  
School  for   Education  and  02  nos.  of  ANM  Centre,  Asha  centre  and  12  nos.  of  AWC  
for  Health  Facilities  to  villagers. 
 
03. BODAPALASA  GP  :-  The  GP  hqr., Bodapalasa   is  only  07  Kms.  away  from  the  
Block  hqr.  This  GP  consists  of  07  villages  and  11  wards. The population  of  the  GP  is  
7296  out  of  which  1521  nos.  are  belong  to  ST  category. The  GP  has  its  own  
building, Cashew  Orchards  and  09  nos. of  GP  Tanks.  Cultivation, Agricultural  labor  and  
to  some  extent  small  scale  business  are  villagers  main  sources  of  income.  This  GP  



has  01  SSD  hostel.  06  nos.  of  UPS,  02  nos.  of  High  Schools  for  providing  
Educational  facilities  and  07  nos.  of  AWC,  Asha  Centers  and  one  ANM  centre  for  
Health  Care.  
 
04. DIMBO  GP  :-  The  distance  of  Dimbo  is  05  kms.  from  Block  hqr. Dimbo  GP  
consists  of  13  villages  and  13  wards. The  population  of  Dimbo  GP  is  7600  out  of  
which  ST  population  is  2960. The  GP  has  own  Building.  Cultivation, Business  and  
Agricultural  labor    are  the  villagers  main  livelihood.  This  GP  has  one  Degree  
Engineering  College,  02  nos.  of  High  Schools,  12  nos.  of  UPS  and  one  SSD  hostel  
to  provide  education  and  15  nos.  of  AWC,  Asha  Centre    and  one  no.  of  ANM  
centre  for  Health  care  of  villagers.  The  WSHG  plays  a  vital  rule  to  produce  Badi  in  
a  large  scale  and  to  generate  income  of  the  women. 
05. GOBARDHAN  GP :-  The  GP  is  situated  at  a  distance  of  14  kms  away  from  
Block  hqr.   The  GP  consists  of  06  no  of  revenue  villages  and  13  no  of ward.  The  
population  of  Gobardhan  GP  is  6011  out  of  which  the  ST  categories  are  2885. 
Business, vegetable  business, agriculture  and  labor  are  the  main  activities  of  the  
villagers  source  of  income.  This  GP  has  one  SSD  hostel,  05  nos.  of  UPS,  02  nos.  
of  High  Schools  to  provide  education  to  villagers  and  10  nos  of  AWC  and  one  no.  
of  ANM  center  for  health  care  to  villagers.  The  SHGs  of  this  GP  play  a  vital  role  for  
the  income  generation  of  women. 
06. HANDIBHANGA  GP :- The  hqr  of  Handibhanga  GP  is  22  kms  away  from  Block  
hqr. The  population  of  the   GP  is  7840  out  of  which  4300  no  are  belong  to  ST  
category. The  GP  consists  of  10 no  revenue  villages  with  15  no  of  ward. Agriculture  
and  Labor  are  the  main  livelihood  factor  of  the  villagers of  this  GP.  This  GP   has  02  
no.  of  SSD  hostel,  10  no.  of  UPS  one  no.  of  High  School  to  provide  education  and  
13  no.  of  AWC,  Asha  centre  and  one  ANM  centre  for  health  care  to  villagers.  
07. JANARDANPUR  GP :-  GP hqr  Janardanpur  is  located  only  05 kms  away  from  
block  hqr.  The population  of  the  GP  is  only  3067 no  which  one  
 is  the  lowest  populated  GP  of  the  Block.  The  GP    consists  of  04  revenue  villages  
and  11  no  of  ward. The  agricultural  land  of  02  villages  of  this  GP are  irrigated  
through  Machakandana   MIP. The  ST  population  of  the  GP  is  2291 no. Paddy  
cultivation  and  labor  are  the  main  income  source  factor  of  the  villagers.  The  GP  has  
one  Degree  Engineering  College,  one  High  Schools  and  04  nos.  of  UPS  to  provide  
better  education  and  06  no.  of  AWC,  Asha  centre  and  one  no.  of  ANM  centre    for  
health  care  to  the  villagers. 
08. KANDRAPOSI  GP :-  GP  hqr  of  Kandraposi  GP  is  situated  25  kms  away  from  
Block  hqr.  This  GP  of  Keonjhargarh  Block  is  the  boarder  of  Joda  and  Jhumpura  
Block  of  Keonjhar  district.  The  population  of  this  GP  is  8622  out  of  which  6829  
population  belong  to  ST  category. This  GP  consists  09  revenue  villages  and  16  no  
wards.  Labor  at  Mines/factory  and  Agriculture  field  so  also  cultivation  are  the  sources  
of  income  of villagers.  This  GP  has  02  no.  of  SSD  hostel,  13  no.  of  UPS  and  02  
no.  of  high  schools  for  the  educational  facilities  and  15  no.  of  AWC  and  one  no.  of  
ANM  centre  for  provision  of  health  care  to  the  villagers.  
09. KATHABARI  GP :-  Kathabari  is  the  boarder  GP  of  this  Block  to  Ghatgaon  and  
Patna  Block. It  is  located  35 kms  away  from  Block  hqr. Population  of  this  GP  is  4918. 
This  area  is  the  coverage  area  under  Kanjhari  Irrigation  Project.  The  villagers  earned  
their  livelihood  mainly  out  of  agriculture  and labor. 2075  no  population  are  belong  to  
ST  category. The  GP  consists  of  08  revenue  villages  and  12  ward.  This  GP  has  one  
no.  of  SSD  hostel,  10  no.  of  UPS,  one  no.  of  high  school  and  09  no.  of  AWC,  
Asha  centre,  and  one  no.  of  ANM  centre  to  impart  better  education  and  health  care  
of  the  villagers  respectively. 
10. KAUNRIKALA  GP :-  GP  hqr  of  Kaunrikala  GP  is  located  22  kms  away  from  
Block  hqr.  The  population  of  the  GP  is  4197  out  of  which  1835  no  belong  to  ST  



category.  The  GP  consists  of  08  revenue  villages  and  11  no  of  ward.  The  villagers  
cultivated  mainly  vegetables  and  paddy.  Some  villagers  depend  on  factories  and  other  
on  labor. This  GP  has  one  SSD  hostel, 06  no.  of  UPS,  02  no.  of  high  schools  to  
provide  education  and  one  no.  of  ANM  centre,  Asha  centre,  and  07  no.  of  AWC  for  
health  ficilities  for  the  villagers. 
 
11.MAHADEIJODA  :-  Mahadeijoda  is  located  17  kms  away  from  Block  hqr. The  total  
GP  is  covered  by  hilly  areas.  The  population  of  Mahadeijoda  GP  is  6287  out  of  
which  ST  category  is  3281.  This  GP  consists  of  06  revenue  villages  and  12  no  of  
ward.  For  livelihood  point  of  view  the  villagers  mainly  depend  on  one  seasoned  crop, 
labor  in  agricultural  field  and  factories.  The  name  of  the  GP  is  legendary. 
Mahadeijoda  was  the  summer  residing  palace  of  Maharani, Keonjhar.  This  GP  has  
one  Govt.  Homeopathy  Dispensary,  one  AWC  centre,  Asha  centre  and  11  no.  of  
AWC  centre  to  provide  health  care  and  one  no.  of  SSD  hostel,12 no.  of  UPS  and  
one  high  school  to  facilitate  better  education  to  the  villagers. 
12. MAIDANKEL :-  Maidankel  GP  is  13  kms  away  from  Block  hqr   and  surrounded  by  
forest. The  population  of  this  GP  is  5764 no  out  of  which  the  ST  population  is  2519.  
The  GP  consists  of  10 no  of  revenue  villages  with  15  no  of  Wards.  Most  of  the  
villagers  depend  on  cash  crop  and  labor.  To  impart  proper  health  care  the  GP  has  
one  no.  of  New  PHC,  one  ANM  centre,  Asha  centre  and  09  no.  of  AWC  as  well  as  
to  provide  better  education  it  has  one  SSD  hostel,  10  no.  of  UPS  and  02  no.  of  
High  Schools. 
13. MANDUA  :- Mandua  GP  is  02  kms  away  from  Block  Office.  All  the  08  no  of  
villages  are  the  periphery  areas  of  Keonjhargarh  Municipality.  The  population  of  this  
GP  is  7518  out  of  which  SC  categories  are  3145  and  ST  categories  are  2811  no.  
The  GP  is  organized  by  11  wards.  As  because  the  villages  are  very  adjacent  to  
town  most  of  the  villagers  depend  on  Keonjhargarh  municipality.  One  seasoned  paddy  
crop, different  type  of  business  and  laboring  are  the  main  activities  of  the  villagers  
livelihood.  This  GP  has  one  SSD  hostel,  05  no.  of  UPS,  one  high  school  to  provide  
education  and  one  ANM  centre,  Asha  centre  and  10.  No.  of  AWC  to  facilitate  health  
care  to  the  villagers. 
14.  NARANPUR  :-  Naranpur  GP  hqr  is  located  only  05  kms  away  from  Block  hqr.  
The  population  of  this  GP  is  9744  out  of  which  the  ST  population  is  4528  no.  
Naranpur  GP  has  14  revenue  villages  and  14  wards. Most  of  the  Keonjhar  railway  
passengers  depend  on  Naranpur  Railway  Station.  The  villagers  of  Naranpur  GP  
depend  on  Agriculture,  Business  and  laboring.  To  facilitate  better  education  and  
health  care  to  the  villagers  the  GP  has  02  no.  of  SSD   hostel,  11  no.  of  UPS,  02  
no.  of  high  school  and  02  no.  of  ANM   centre,  Asha  centre  and  13  no.  of  AWC  
centre  respectively. 
15.  NELUNG  GP  :-  Nelung  GP  hqr  is  located  only  05  kms  away  from  Block  hqr.  
The  population  of  Nelung  GP  is  5256  no  out  of  which  the  ST population  is  2643.  
The  GP  consists  of  07  no  of  revenue  villages  with  11  no  of  ward.  The  villagers  of  
Nelung  GP  depend  on  one  seasoned  crop ,Laboring  and  Business  to  maintain  their  
livelihood. This  GP  has  one  Degree  College, 02  no.  of  SSD  hostel,  08  no.  of  UPS,  
one  no.  of  high  school  to  impart  education  and    one  no.  of  ANM  centre,  Asha  
centre  and  09  no.  of  AWC  centre  to  provide  health  care  to  the  villagers  respectively. 
16.  NUAGAON  GP  :-  The  GP  hqr  of  Nuagaon  GP  is  20  kms  away  from  Block  hqr.  
This  GP  consists  of  13  no  of  revenue  villages  with  19  ward.  The  population  of  
Nuagaon  GP  is  8985  out  of  which  5597  are  belong  to  ST  category.  Most  of  the  
villagers  depend  on  crop ,business  and  laboring  to  maintain  their  livelihood. This  GP  
has  15  no.  of  UPS,  02  no.  of  high  school,  02  no.  of  SSD  hostel  to  impart  education  
and  15  no.  of  AWW  centre,  Asha  centre  and    two  no.  of  ANM  centre  to  deliver  
health  care  to  the  villagers.  The  Hat  of  this  GP  is  the  biggest  hat  of  Block. 



17.  PADAMPUR  GP  :-  GP  hqr  of  Padampur  is  located  12  kms  away  from  Block  
hqr.  The  population  of  the  GP   is 7067  no.  out  of  which  ST  categories  are  4213.  
The  GP  consists  of  08  revenue  villages  with  11  no.   of  ward.  Business, Cropping  and  
laboring  are  the  main  essential  factor  of  sources  of  income  of  the  GP  villagers. This  
GP  has  a  Degree  College, 09  no.  of  UPS,  02  no.  of  high  school  and  one  no.  of  
SSD  hostel  to  impart  education  and  one  CHC,  one  ANM  centre,  Asha  centre  and  09  
no.  of  AWW  centre  to  provide  health  care  of  the  villagers. 
18. PALASPONGA  GP  :-  Palasponga  GP  hqr  is  situated  18  kms  away  from  Block  
hqr.  This  GP  consists  of  13  revenue  villages  and  14  no.  of  ward.  The  population  of  
this  GP  is  7616  out  of  which  3151  no.  belong  to  ST  category.  Most  of  the  villagers  
of  this  GP  are  engaged  in  factory  and  mines  area,  agricultural  field  and  laboring.  
SPONGE  IRON  ORE  LIMITED  and   MSP  steel  Plant  are  situated  in  this  GP.  The  
GP  has  one  SSD  hostel,  08  no.  of  UPS  and  one  high  school  to  impart  education  
and  one  no.  of  ANM  centre,  Asha  centre  and 12  no.  of  AWW  centre  to  care  the  
health  of  the  villagers. 
19.PARJANPUR  GP  :-  Parjanpur  GP  hqr.  is  24  Kms  away  from  Block  hqr.  The  
population  of  Parjanpur  GP  is  6865  out  of  which  2962  no.  of  population  belong  to  
ST  category.  The  GP  consists  13  no.  of  revenue  villages  with  14  ward.  The  main  
livelihood  activities  of  the  villagers  of  Parjanpur  are  Agriculture, Laboring.  For  health  
care  point  of  view  the  GP  has  one  new  PHC, 02  no.  of  ANM  centre,  Asha  centre  
and11  no.  of AWW  centre.  To  provide  education  to  the  villagers  the  GP  has  one  
SSD  hostel, one  high  school  and  12  no.  of  UPS. 
20. RAGHUNATHPUR  GP  :-  The  hqr  of  Raghunathpur  GP  is  located  27  kms  away  
from  Block  hqr.  and  is  covered  under  Kanjhari  Irrigation  Project.  The  Population  of   
this  GP  is  7504  and  out  of  this    3367  no.  of  people  are    belong    to  ST category.  
The  GP  consists  of  16  no.  of  revenue  villages  with  15  ward.  The  main  livelihood  
activities  of  the  villagers  are  Paddy  cultivation,  vegetable  cropping  and  laboring.  For  
better  health  care  to  villagers  the  GP  has  one  Govt.  Homeopathy  Dispensary,  02  no.  
of  ANM  centre,  Asha  centre  and  16  no.  of  AWW  centre.  To  impart  education  the  GP  
has  one  no.  of  SSD  hostel,  13  no.  of  UPS  and  02  no.  of  High  Schools. 
21. RAIKALA  GP  :-  The  hqr  of  Raikala  GP  is  28  Kms  away  from  Block  hqr.  The  
population  of  this  GP  6701, out  of  this  3237  no  are belong  to  ST  category.  The  GP  
consists   of  11  no  of  revenue  villages  with14  no  of  ward.  The  basic  livelihood  of  the  
villagers  are  cropping  and  laboring  both  in  factory/mines  and  agricultural  field.  This  
GP  is  the  boarder  area  of  Keonjhargarh  block  and  adjacent  to  Jhumpura  Block.  To  
deliver  health  care  to  the  villagers  the  GP  has  one  no.  of  ANM  centre,  Asha  
centers, and  12  no.  of  AWW  centre  likewise  to  provide  education  it  has  11  nos.  of  
UPS/MES  and   02  no.  of  High  Schools. 
22.  RAISUAN  GP  :-  Raisuan  GP  is  located  07  kms  away  from  Block  hqr. It  is  the  
thickly  populated  GP  of  Keonjhargarh  Block  with  a  population  of  10533  and  ST  
population  of  5407  no.  This  GP  consists  of  12  revenue  villages  organized  with  18  
ward.  Basically  the  villagers  main  livelihood  activities  are  Agriculture,  Business  and  
labor  in  both  agriculture  and  non-agriculture  field.  For  health  care  point  of  view  the  
GP  has  one  New PHC, 01  no.  of  ANM  centre,  Asha  centers,  and  15  no.  of  AWW  
centers.  To  deliver  better  education  the  GP  has  one  +2  College,  10  no.  of  UPS,  one  
high  school  and  one  SSD  hostel. 
23.  SANKIRI  GP  :-  Sankiri  GP  hqr   is  24  kms  away  from  Block  hqr.  The  population  
of  this  GP  is  4792,  out  of  which  the  ST  categories  are  2522.  This  GP  consists   of  
06  revenue  villages  with  11  no.  of  wards.  Basically  the  villagers  are  depending  on  
agriculture  and  laboring  in  both  the  fields. The  GP  has  one  New  PHC,  02  no.  of  
ANM  centre,  Asha  centre,  09  no.  of  AWW  centre  to  facilitate  the  health  care  of  the  
villagers.  To  impart  better  education  to  the  children  it  has  07  no.  of  UPS/MES  and  
02  no.  of  high  schools. 



  
24. SIRISPAL  GP  :-   Sirispal  GP  hqr  is  only  12  kms  away  from  Block  hqr.  It  
consists  08  no.  of  revenue  villages  with  12  no. of  Ward. The  population  of  this  GP  is  
8412,  out  of  which  3539  are  tribals. The  livelihood  activities  of  the  villagers  are  
agriculture  and  laboring.  For  education  point  of  view  this  GP  carries  one  Sevashram,  
02  no.  of  SSD  hostel,  10  no.  of  UPS /MES  and  one  no.  of  high  school  and  to  
deliver  health  care  to  the  villagers  the  GP  has  09  no.  of  AWW,  01  no.  of  ANM  and  
Asha  centers. 
 
 

GHATGAON BLOCK 
GP PROFILES  

01. Mukundapurpatna GP 

Mukundapurpatna GP under Ghatgaon Block is 0.3 K.m from Block headquarter. The total 
no of population is 6695.(ST 2519 SC 677  & others 929 households 1538). The main source 
of livelihoods is agriculture. There are 7 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards &6 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 10 no of 
Primary / Upper primary schools & two high schools. T.T Mahavidyalaya ,Ghatgaon is an 
important centre of higher education for the tribal dominated people of this G.P. There are 
two mobile tower for better communication purposes.  The G.P has been awarded the best 
G.P as per district level performance parameters. Mo-Dakhyata, Mo-Sahara & Scholarships 
to poor talented students are the own schemes of the GP that speak volumes of its overall 
excellence. This G.P is famous for Maa Tarini Temple & the scenic beauty of Gundichaghagi 
water fall. Chaiti Parba,Ghatgaon Mahotshab &Ravanpodi are the impotant festive occasions 
that lure a number of tourists to the G.P. The G.P has a good source of own income from its 
market complexes & Hat . 

02. Khantaghar G.P 

Khantaghar  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 15 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3223.(ST 2285 SC 209  & others 393 households 706). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 4 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 4 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health.The G.P has 5 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools . There is one mobile tower for better communication 
purposes.  

03. Pipilia GP 

Pipilia GP under Ghatgaon Block is 22 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4847.(ST 3265 SC 175 & others 568 households 1101). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 5 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 5 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 7 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools  & 03 high schools. L.N Mahavidyalaya ,Pipilia is an 
important centre of higher education for the tribal dominated people of this G.P. There are 07 
mobile towers  for better communication purposes.  

04. Dhenkikote GP 

Dhenkikote  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 13 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 5181.(ST 2596 SC 259 & others 619 households 1217 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 4 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 5 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 7 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools  & 02 high schools. S.N Mahavidyalaya ,Dhenkikote is an 



important centre of higher education for the tribal dominated people of this G.P. There is 02 
mobile towers  for better communication purposes.  
 
05. Manoharpur GP 

Manoharpur  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 20 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4895.(ST 3735 SC 157 & others 656 households 1022 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 8 no of revenue villages with 12 no of wards & 08 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 09 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools  & 02 high schools.  There is 01 mobile tower for better 
communication purposes. Sitabinj, an ancient center of historical importance is one of the 
significant tourist attractions of Keonjhar district. Visitors from all around Odisha come here 
to witness the natural stone carvings , stone paintings of Ramayan Era & other scenic 
wonders of this hilly region. 

06. Bholabeda GP 

Bholabeda  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 23 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3706.(ST 2819 SC 195 & others 493 households 874 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 03 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 03 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 05 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools  & 01 high school.  

07. Basantapur GP 

Basantapur GP under Ghatgaon Block is 40 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4313.(ST 2777 SC 401 & others 583 households 1010 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 4 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 5 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 05 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools  & 01 high school. There are 03 mobile towers  for better 
communication purposes. 
08. Patilo GP 

Patilo GP under Ghatgaon Block is 28 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3860.(ST 2352 SC 291 & others 488 households 968 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 9 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 5 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 7 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. There is 01 mobile tower  for better 
communication purposes. There is 01 Jagannath temple & 01 Shiv temple in this G.P for 
religious purposes. 

09. Binida GP 

Binida GP under Ghatgaon Block is 30 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3627.(ST 2410 SC 223 & others 569 households 812 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 04 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 5 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 05 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. There is 01 mobile tower for better 
communication purposes. 

10.Paidapatna GP 
Paidapatna GP under Ghatgaon Block is 12 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4006.(ST 2677 SC 169 & others 495 households 962 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 04 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 04 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 05 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools . 



 

11. Santarapur GP 

Santarapur  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 16 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4759.(ST 2901 SC 440 & others 659 households 1075 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 03 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 04 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 06 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. The GP is home to Juangas, one of the 
oldest tribes of India like Jayantia, Garo,Khasi,Jarwas & Dangariyas. The Kuladera village, a 
hilly terrain of Santarapur GP is the home of Juangas. 

12. Toranipokhari GP 

Toranipokhari  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 28 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 6496.(ST 3564 SC 373 & others 888 households 1483 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 10 no of revenue villages with 14 no of wards & 09 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 10 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 02 high schools. There are 02 mobile towers  for better 
communication purposes.  

13. Badajamupasi GP 

Badajamupasi   GP under Ghatgaon Block is 07 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 7826.(ST 5164 SC 182 & others 1111 households 1622 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 07 no of revenue villages with 15 no of wards & 05 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 10 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 03 high schools. There is 01 mobile tower  for better 
communication purposes.  

14. Pandapada GP 

Pandapada  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 30 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3521.(ST 2421 SC 92 & others 505 households 851 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 04 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 04 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 06 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. There are 02 mobile towers  for better 
communication purposes. 

15. Sunatangiri GP 

Sunatangiri  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 32 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3327.(ST 2705 SC 05 & others 437 households 824 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 03 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 03 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 04 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. The GP headquarter in Sunatangiri is yet 
to be constructed as the proposed location has been a bone of contention among the 03 
villages. 

16. PurumundaGP 

Purumunda GP under Ghatgaon Block is 34 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4937.(ST 3515 SC 427 & others 615 households 1119 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 07 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 05 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 07 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. The GP is home to Juangas, one of the 



oldest tribes of India like Jayantia, Garo,Khasi,Jarwas & Dangariyas. The Gayalmunda 
village, a hilly terrain of Purumunda GP is the home of Juangas. 

17. Upperdiha GP 

Upperdiha  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 1 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 8513.(ST 5168 SC 520 & others 1442 households 1850 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 05 no of revenue villages with 12 no of wards & 07 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 12 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 03 high schools. There are 08 mobile towers for better 
communication purposes.  

18. Gadadharpur GP 

Gadadharpur  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 7 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4017.(ST 1934 SC 154 & others 518 households 938 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 06 no of revenue villages with 12 no of wards & 05 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 06 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 02 high schools. There are 03 mobile towers for better 
communication purposes. Apart from agriculture Terracotta is booming into an important 
source of small cottage industry especially in the village of Bataharichandanpur , 
Gadadharpur. Sanischar temple amidst the scenic beauty of jungle is the main centre of 
religious activities for the G.P. 

19. Tara GP 

Tara GP under Ghatgaon Block is 07 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of population 
is 4999.(ST 2599 SC 713 & others 643 households 1213 ). The main source of livelihoods is 
agriculture. There are 07 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 06 no of polling 
stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 07 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. There is 01 mobile tower for better 
communication purposes.  

20. Saraspasi GP 

Saraspasi GP under Ghatgaon Block is 30 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 2909.(ST 2123 SC 138 & others 361 households 664 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 05 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 05 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 06 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school.  

21. Badamasinabilla GP 

Badamasinabilla GP under Ghatgaon Block is 11 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no 
of population is 4657.(ST 3561 SC 66 & others 673 households 1041 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 05 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 05 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 10 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. 

22. Muktapur GP 

Muktapur  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 20 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3779.(ST 2590 SC 25 & others 538 households 835 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 07 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 05 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 09 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 02 high schools.  



23. Barahatipura GP 

Barahatipura GP under Ghatgaon Block is 10 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3023.(ST 1795 SC 318 & others 498 households 646 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 04 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 04 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 06 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school. There is 01 mobile tower for better 
communication purposes. Nilakantheswar temple is the centre of tourist attraction which is 
located on the top of a small mountain enriched with scenic wonder of different plants and 
naturally designed rocks. Makar Sankranti is celebrated here with awe & affection and for 15 
days makeshift shops , Opera and other cultural programmes continue to entertain the 
people around Keonjhar & Mayurbhanj. 

24. Balipokhari GP 

. Balipokhari   GP under Ghatgaon Block is 10 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 4716.(ST 2643 SC 561 & others 742 households 1072 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 09 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 06 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 08 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school.  

25. Rutisila GP 

Rutisila GP under Ghatgaon Block is  37 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3544 .(ST 2933 SC 34 & others 440 households 769 ). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 05 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 05 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 06 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools. There is 01 mobile tower for better communication 
purposes. Mango cultivation has been flourishing in this region to boost economic condition 
of the backward people. Recently rain water management has been geared up by the help of 
WOSCA  to improve the fertility and productivity of the soil. 

26. Badapichulla GP 

Badapichulla  GP under Ghatgaon Block is 40 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no of 
population is 3192.(ST 3019 SC 24 & others 453 households 730). The main source of 
livelihoods is agriculture. There are 02 no of revenue villages with 11 no of wards & 02 no of 
polling stations. The people have easy access to education and health. The G.P has 04 no of 
primary / Upper primary schools & 01 high school.  

PATNA BLOCK,  DIST-KEONJHAR 

The Block started functioning with effect from 01.04.1960 in its own building. All 
weather road connection is available to this Block and 40 kms away from District 
headquarter. Total geographical area of this block – 41,639.60 Hec. Total cultivable area – 
25440.00 Hector. Irrigated Area – in Kharif – 9274.00 Hector, Rabi – 2226.00 Hec. The Block 
comprises of 20 GPs and 154 revenue Village and 268 nos. of wards. Total Population of the 
Block is 101526, Male – 50548, Female- 50978. Category wise S C – 7706, S T – 53405, OC 
– 40415. Total Nos of medical – 06, (CHC-1, PHC- 3, Hospital – 1, Dispensary- 1) Ayurbedic 
Dispensary- 01, Homeopathic – 02. The Block comes under 3 Police Station namely 1) 
Patna (6 GP), 2) Turumunga (11 GP), 3) Ghatagaon (3 GP). 24 Nos. Of PWS systems 
working in this Block providing water supply to 35 villages. Out of 154 villages, 126 villages 
have been electrified fully /partially. The main source of livelihood of the people of this block 
is agriculture and allied activities. Total 969 WSHGs are active in this block consisting of 
11628 members. Total Nos. Of BPL family are 11152 as per 1997 survey list out of 24042 
families as per 2011 census.      



GP PROFILE OF PATNA BLOCK 

Badapatna  

Badapatna gram panchayat under Patna Block is 1.5  kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Patna police station. The total GP comprises of .22 villages and18 wards having.07 
nos of polling stations. The total population of GP is 7720 .out of which male population is 
3903 and female population is 3817  categorically the population is divided as SC..514 , 
ST.3206 , and others 4000.  The main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. 
All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have 
easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately. 21000 the 845 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 65. 

Baunsuli 

Baunsuli gram panchayat under Patna Block is 26  kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 06 villages and 16 wards 
having..08 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is 6307 out of which male 
population is 3089 and female population is 3218  categorically the population is divided as 
SC-386., ST.3353, and others 2568  the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity 
and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building 
etc and the total income of the GP is approximately18000  the 936....nos of female members 
are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat  is 72. 

Budhikapudi 

Budhikapudi gram panchayat under Patna Block is..32 kms from Block head quarter. It 
comes under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 11 villages and 14 wards 
having 06 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.5077, out of which male 
population is2484 and female population is.2593  categorically the population is divided as 
SC 613,. ST..1788....., and others..2676. The main source of livelihood is agriculture and 
allied activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people 
of the GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with 
electricity and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, 
market building etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.12720....... the 910....nos 
of female members are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the 
panchayat is 70. 

Chakundapal 

Chakundapal..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 15 kms from Block head quarter. It 
comes under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 06 villages and 11 wards 
having 04 nos. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.3494 out of which male 
population is 1755 and female population is 1739 categorically the population is divided as 
SC-293, ST-332, and others 869  the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with no 
electricity and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, 
market building etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.800 the 468 nos. of 
female members are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat 
is 36. 



Chemana 

Chemana..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 30 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 10 villages and 16 wards having 
08 nos. of polling stations. The total population of GP is 6164 out of which male population is 
3086 and female population is.3078 categorically the population is divided as SC-489, ST-
2287, and others 3388 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 
major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.19000 the 1105nos. of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 85. 

Chinamaliposi 

Chinamaliposi gram panchayat under Patna Block is 12 kms from Block head quarter. It 
comes under ghatagaon police station. The total GP comprises of  05 villages and 12 wards 
having 05 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.4859 out of which male 
population is 2429 and female population is.2430 categorically the population is divided as 
SC-206, ST-3224, and others 1229 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity 
and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building 
etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.7090 the 442 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total nos. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 34. 

Dumuria 

Dumuria..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 18  kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Ghatagaon police station. The total GP comprises of 10 villages and 17 wards having 
08 nos. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.7618out of which male population is 
3767 and female population is 3851 categorically the population is divided as SC-164, ST-
5136, and others 2318 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 
major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.18000 the 640 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 49. 

Erendei 

Erendei gram panchayat under Patna Block is 05 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Patna police station. The total GP comprises of 03 villages and 11 wards having 03 
nos. of polling stations. The total population of GP is 2992 out of which male population is 
1423 and female population is 1519 categorically the population is divided as SC-285, ST-
1673, and others 984 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 
major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.28186 the 221 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 17. 

Jamunaposi 

Jamunaposi..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 20 kms from Block head quarter. It 
comes under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 06 villages and 12 wards 



having 05 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is 4287 out of which male 
population is2106 and female population is 2181 categorically the population is divided as 
SC-282, ST-2508, and others 1497 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity 
and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building 
etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.16195 the 728 nos of female members 
are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 56. 

Kantiapada 

Kantiapada..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 18 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 07 villages and 12 wards having 
05 nos. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.4672 out of which male population is 
2339 and female population is.2333 categorically the population is divided as SC-468, ST-
1952, and others 2252 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 
major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with no electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.1100. the 611 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 47. 

Kendeiposi 

Kendeiposi..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 13 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 09 villages and 15 wards having 
08 nos. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.6561 out of which male population is 
3289 and female population is. 3272  categorically the population is divided as SC-1030, ST-
3722 and others 1809 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 
major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.25000 the 728 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 56. 

Khireitangiri 

Khireitangiri..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 24 kms from Block head quarter. It 
comes under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 05 villages and 12 wards 
having 05 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.5327 out of which male 
population is 2670 and female population is.2657 categorically the population is divided as 
SC-400, ST-3343, and others 1584 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity 
and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building 
etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.24500. the 475 nos of female members 
are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 46. 

Mirigikhoji 

Mirigikhoji..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 07 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Patna police station. The total GP comprises of 05 villages and 12 wards having 02 
nos. of polling stations. The total population of GP is 2383 out of which male population is 
1161 and female population is 1222 categorically the population is divided as SC-47, ST-
1034, and others1302 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 



major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.8410 the 260 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 22. 

:Murusuan 

Murusuan..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 17 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 09 villages and 15 wards 
having04no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is 4566 out of which male 
population is 2289 and female population is 2277 categorically the population is divided as 
SC-281, ST-1702, and others 2583 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity 
and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building 
etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.13350 the 572 nos of female members 
are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 44. 

Mushakhori 

Mushakhori..Gram Panchayat under Patna Block is 08 kms from Block head quarter. It 
comes under Patna police station. The total GP comprises of 08 villages and 11 wards 
having 05 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is. 4522 out of which male 
population is 2285 and female population is 2237  categorically the population is divided as 
SC-505, ST-1623, and others 2394 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity 
and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building 
etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.62000 the 516 nos of female members 
are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 43. 

Palanghati 

Palanghati..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 17  kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Ghatagaon police station. The total GP comprises of 05 villages and 11 wards 
having04 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.3933 out of which male 
population is 1926 and female population is.2007. categorically the population is divided as 
SC- 87, ST-2700, and others 1146. the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP office has its own building with no 
electricity and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, 
market building etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.22000 the 364 nos of 
female members are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat 
is 28 . 

Rajnagar 

Rajnagar..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 20 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 07 villages and 11wards having 
04.no of polling stations. The total population of GP is 3758 out of which male population is 
1811 and female population is.1947. categorically the population is divided as SC 290, ST 
2240, and others 1228  the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 
major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 



system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.58000 the 520 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 41. 

Saraskola 

Saraskola gram panchayat under Patna Block is 08 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under...Patna police station. The total GP comprises of 04 villages and 11 wards having 04 
no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.3744 out of which male population 
is1871 and female population is.1873 categorically the population is divided as SC 166, ST 
2125, and others 1453  the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the 
major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy 
access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS 
system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and 
the total income of the GP is approximately.28200  the 395 nos of female members are 
included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 38. 

Tangarpada 

Tangarpada gram panchayat under Patna Block is 07 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Patna police station. The total GP comprises of 09 villages and 18 wards having07 no. 
of polling stations. The total population of GP is 7686 out of which male population is 3868 
and female population is 3818 categorically the population is divided as SC 690, ST 4514, 
and others 2422 the main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied activities. All the major 
villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the GP have easy access 
to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity and PWS system. The 
main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building etc and the total 
income of the GP is approximately.21500 the 636 nos of female members are included in the 
WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 53. 

Turumunga 

Turumunga..gram panchayat under Patna Block is 24 kms from Block head quarter. It comes 
under Turumunga police station. The total GP comprises of 07 villages and 13 wards 
having07 no. of polling stations. The total population of GP is.5906 out of which male 
population is 2997 and female population is 2909  categorically the population is divided as 
SC.310 , ST 2943 , and others 2653. The main source of livelihood is agriculture and allied 
activities. All the major villages are well connected with GP head quarters and people of the 
GP have easy access to rural transport system. The GP has its own building with electricity 
and PWS system. The main source of income of the GP is from Hats, ponds, market building 
etc and the total income of the GP is approximately.37650 the 910 nos of female members 
are included in the WSHG fold and the total no. Of WSHG in the panchayat is 77. 

SAHARPADA BLOCK  

GP PROFILE : BAIKALA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1992. The GP is geographically  bounded 
by Saharpada GP in the east and Malarpada GP in the West. Deo river in the North, 
Khuntapada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 8K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :     
Total Geographical area    : 2080.01 Hect. 

1. Agricultural Area    : 1260 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village    : 7 nos. 



3  Total no. of Wards    : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census  : 4,431  

(a) Male     : 2097  47.33% 
(b) Female     : 2334  52.67% 
(c) S.C.     : 237       5.35% 
(d) S.T.     : 3285     74.14% 
(e) Others       : 25,119     20.51% 

  5.  Literacy      :2647 (Male : 1443/ Female : 1204) 
  6. PHC      :0 1 
  7.  ANM Centre    : 01 
  8 Anganwardi Centre   : 07 
  9.  Pry. School    : 07 
  10. High School    : 02 
 GP PROFILE : BARBIL 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1982. The GP is geographically  bounded 
by Raidiha GP in the east and Gandabeda GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the 
North, Tendra GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 7K.M. away from this GP.  
All weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 2016.52  Hect. 
  Agricultural Area   : 1409 Hect.      
2. Total no. of Village   : 8 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 12 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 5100  
(a) Male    : 2494  48.94% 
(b) Female    : 2606  51.10% 
(c) S.C.    : 83      1.78% 
(d) S.T.    : 2843     55.75% 
(e) Others      : 2166     42.47% 
  5.  Literacy  :3093  (Male : 1710, Female : 1383) 
  6. Veterinary Centre - 1 
  7. ANM Centre  - 1 
  8. Anganwardi Centre - 1  
  9. Pry. School  - 8 
  10.  High School  - 1 

GP PROFILE : DALAPAKA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 2002. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Tel river in the east and Kundala & Khadikapada GP in the West. Damahuda GP in 
the North, Baitarani river in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 25K.M. away from 
this GP.  All weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         

1. Total Geographical area  : 1894.31  Hect. 
  Agricultural Area  : 1443 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 6 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 3498  
(a) Male    : 1725  49.31% 
(b) Female    : 1773  50.65% 
(c) S.C.    : 188     5.37% 
(d) S.T.    : 2254     64.44% 



(e) Others      : 1056     30.19% 
  5.  Literacy  :1594 (Male : 943, Female : 651) 
  6. Anganwardi Centre - 6 
  7. Pry. School  - 6 
  8. High School  - 1 
 
 

     GP PROFILE : DAMAHUDA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1994. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Tel river in the east and Khadikapada GP in the West. Machhagarh GP in the 
North, Dalapaka GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 22K.M. away from this 
GP.  All weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         

1. Total Geographical area  : 1679.51Hect.    
  Agricultural Area  : 1198 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 7 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 4104  
(a) Male    : 1997  48.66% 
(b) Female    : 2107  51.34% 
(c) S.C.    : 109     2.66% 
(d) S.T.    : 2930    71.39% 
(e) Others      : 1065     25.95% 
  5.  Literacy  :2167 (Male : 1216, Female : 951) 
  6. L.I. Centre   - 1 
  7.  Ayurvedic Dispensary - 1 
  8. PHC     - 1 
  9. ANM Centre   - 1 
  10.  Anganwardi Centre  - 7 
  11. Pry. School   - 7 
  12. High School   - 1 
  13. Girls High School  - 1 

      GP PROFILE :DIGIPOSI 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1953. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         

1. Total Geographical area  : 1809.81Hect.   
  Agricultural Area  : 1113 Hect.                                             
2. Total no. of Village   : 9 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 2600  
(a) Male    : 1272  48.92% 
(b) Female    : 1328  51.08% 
(c) S.C.    : 162    6.23% 
(d) S.T.    : 1979     76.12% 
(e) Others      : 459     17.65% 
  5.  Literacy  :1315 (Male : 774, Female : 541) 
  6. Pry. School   - 6 
  7.  High School   - 1 
  8.  ANM Centre   - 1 



  9. Anganwardi Centre  - 6 
   

         GP PROFILE : GANDABEDA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 2002. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :       
1. Total Geographical area   : 1922.04Hect.                                              
 Agricultural Area    : 648 Hect. 
2. Total no. of Village    : 8 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards    : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census  : 4148 
(a) Male      : 2003  48.29% 
(b) Female      : 2145  51.71% 
(c) S.C.      : 45      1.08% 
(d) S.T.      : 3326     80.18% 
(e) Others        : 777     18.73% 
5.  Literacy       :2371(Male- 1393/ Female : 978) 
6. ANM Centre     : 01 
7. Pry. School     :08 
8.  High School     :0 1 
9.  Anganwardi Centre    :0 8 

 GP PROFILE : GORAS 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1984. This GP is geographically  bounded by 
Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, Silipada 
GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All weather road 
communication is available to this GP headquarter.  
The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area   : 1524.43 Hect. 
  Agricultural Area   : 1234 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 5 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 3833  

(a) Male    : 1822  47.53% 
(b) Female    : 2011  52.47% 
(c) S.C.    : 218    5.69% 
(d) S.T.    : 3563     92.96% 
(e) Others      : 52      1.35% 

  5.  Literacy  :1997 (Male : 1124, Female : 873) 
  6. ANM Centre  - 1 
  7. Pry. School  - 5 
  8. High School  - 1 
  9.  Anganwardi Centre - 5 

 GP PROFILE : KAPUNDI 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1992. This GP is geographically  bounded by 
Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, Silipada 
GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All weather road 
communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :        
1. Total Geographical area   : 1654.93Hect.    



  Agricultural Area   : 1031 Hect.                                             
2. Total no. of Village   : 5 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 3798  

(a) Male    : 1871  49.26% 
(b) Female    : 1927  50.74% 
(c) S.C.    : 387    10.19% 
(d) S.T.    : 1371    36.10% 
(e) Others      : 2040     53.71% 

  5.  Literacy  :2263 (Male : 1260, Female : 995) 
  6.  ANM Centre  - 1 
  7.  Pry. School  - 5 
  8.  High School  - 1 
  9.  Anganwardi Centre - 5 

    GP PROFILE : KHADIKAPADA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. . This GP is geographically  bounded by 
Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 2031.28Hect.          
  Agricultural Area   : 1108 Hect.                                       
2. Total no. of Village   : 6 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 3411 

(a) Male    : 1672  49.02% 
(b) Female    : 1739  50.98% 
(c) S.C.    : 139    4.08% 
(d) S.T.    : 2105   61.71% 
(e) Others      : 1167     34.21% 

  5.  Literacy  :1620 (Male : 939, Female : 681)  
  6. ANM Centre  - 1 
  7.  Pry. School  - 5 
  8. High School  - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre - 6 

   GP PROFILE :KHAJIRAPAT 

This GP started functioning   w. e f.1959 . This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         

1. Total Geographical area  : 2019.61Hect.      
 Agricultural Area   : 1477 Hect.                                           
2. Total no. of Village   : 10 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 12 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 4665  

(a) Male    : 2315  49.62% 
(b) Female    : 2350  50.38% 
(c) S.C.    : 73      1.56% 
(d) S.T.    : 2288     49.05% 
(e) Others      : 2304     49.39% 

  5.  Literacy  :2660 (Male : 1551, Female : 1109) 
  6. Pry. School  - 9 



  7. High School  - 1 
  8. ANM Centre  - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre - 10  

    GP PROFILE : KUNTAPADA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. . This GP is geographically  bounded by 
Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 1470.78Hect.       
  Agricultural Area   : 519 Hect.                                          
2. Total no. of Village   : 5 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 3610  

(a) Male    : 1818  50.36% 
(b) Female    : 1792  49.64% 
(c) S.C.    : 78     2.16% 
(d) S.T.    : 2277     63.07% 
(e) Others      : 1255     34.76% 

  5.  Literacy  :1996 (Male : 1181, Female : 851)  
  6. Pry. School  - 5 
  7. High School  - 1 
  8. ANM Centre  - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre - 5 

GP PROFILE : KUNDALA 
This GP started functioning   w. e f. . This GP is geographically  bounded by 

Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 1705.56Hect.   
  Agricultural Area   : 1027 Hect.                                              
2. Total no. of Village   : 5 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 3959  

(a) Male    : 1950  49.25% 
(b) Female    : 2009  50.75% 
(c) S.C.    : 254     6.42% 
(d) S.T.    : 2791     70.50% 
(e) Others      : 914     23.08% 

  5.  Literacy  :2160 (Male : 1226, Female : 934) 
  6. ANM Centre  - 1 
  7. Pry. School  - 5 
  8. High School  - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre - 5 

      GP PROFILE : MACHHAGARH 
This GP started functioning   w. e f.1995 . This GP is geographically  bounded 

by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 2620.99Hect. 
  Agricultural Area   : 1810 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 9 nos. 



3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 6314  
(a) Male    : 3119  49.40% 
(b) Female    : 3195  50.60% 
(c) S.C.    : 176     2.79% 
(d) S.T.    : 3365     53.29% 
(e) Others      : 2773     43.92% 
  5.  Literacy  :3271 (Male : 1860, Female : 1411) 
  6.  Ayurvedic dispensary   - 1 
  7.  Pry. School    - 9 
  8. High School    - 10 
  9. College    - 1 
  10.  ANM Centre    - 1 
  11.  Aganwardi Centre   - 9 

          GP PROFILE : MALARPADA 
This GP started functioning   w. e f.1953 . This GP is geographically  bounded 

by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 22K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 2277.23 Hect. 
 Agricultural Area   : 1483 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 10 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 14 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 5504  

(a) Male    : 2763  50.20% 
(b) Female    : 2741  49.80% 
(c) S.C.    : 1133   20.59% 
(d) S.T.    : 3201     58.16% 
(e) Others      : 1170     21.26% 

  5.  Literacy  :3561 (Male : 2039, Female : 1522) 
  6. ANM Centre   - 1 
  7. Pry. School   - 10 
  8.  High School   - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre  - 10 

 GP PROFILE : RAIDIHA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1984. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 1854.70Hect.     
  Agricultural Area   : 1716 Hect.                                            
2. Total no. of Village   : 6 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 4428  

(a) Male    : 2104  47.52% 
(b) Female    : 2324  52.48% 
(c) S.C.    : 180     4.07% 
(d) S.T.    : 3245     73.28% 
(e) Others      : 1003     22.65% 

  5.  Literacy  :2370 (Male : 1273, Female : 1097) 
  6. PHC   - 1 
  7. ANM Centre  - 1 
  8.  Pry. School  - 6 



  9. High School  - 1 
  10. College  - 1 
  11. Anganwardi Centre - 6 

            GP PROFILE : SAHARPADA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. . This GP is geographically  bounded by 
Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         

1. Total Geographical area  : 3018.41Hect.       
  Agricultural Area  : 2333 Hect.                                          
2. Total no. of Village   : 9 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 16 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 8388  

(a) Male    : 4074  48.57% 
(b) Female    : 4314  51.43% 
(c) S.C.    : 658     7.84% 
(d) S.T.    : 5848     69.72% 
(e) Others      : 1882    22.44% 

  5.  Literacy  :4829 (Male : 2777, Female : 2052) 
  6. PHC   - 1 
  7. ANM Centre  - 1 
  8. Pry. School  - 9 
  9. High School  - 1 
  10. College  - 1 
  11. Anganwardi Centre - 9 

           GP PROFILE : SANKHUA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 2002. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :       
  

1. Total Geographical area  : 1470.55Hect.     
 Agricultural Area   : 1198 Hect.                                            
2. Total no. of Village   : 7 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 3374  

(a) Male    : 1522  45.11% 
(b) Female    : 1852  54.89% 
(c) S.C.    : 462     13.69% 
(d) S.T.    : 1596     47.31% 
(e) Others      : 1316     39.00% 

  5.  Literacy  :1882 (Male : 1091, Female : 791) 
  6. ANM Centre  - 1 
  7. Pry. School  - 7 
  8. High School  - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre - 7 

    GP PROFILE : SILIPADA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f.1984 . This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 



Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1. Total Geographical area  : 1875.12 Hect. 
  Agricultural Area   : 965 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 4 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 4214  

(a) Male     c: 2112  50.12% 
(b) Female    : 2102  49.88% 
(c) S.C.    : 1513   35.90% 
(d) S.T.    : 1189     28.22% 
(e) Others      : 1512     35.88% 

  5.  Literacy  :2702 (Male : 1533, Female : 1169) 
  6. Pry. School  - 4 
  7. High School  -1 
  8 ANM Centre  - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre - 4 

 

     GP PROFILE : TENDRA 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1992. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         

1. Total Geographical area  : 1452.19 Hect. 
  Agricultural Area   : 1343 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 8 nos. 
3  Total no. of Wards   : 11 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 2852  

(a) Male    : 1545  54.17% 
(b) Female    : 1302  45.65% 
(c) S.C.    : 146     5.12% 
(d) S.T.    : 1398     49.02% 

(e) Others       : 1308     45.86% 
  5.  Literacy  :1771 (Male : 988, Female : 783) 
  6. Pry. School  - 5 
  7. High School  - 1 
  8. ANM Centre  - 1 
  9. Anganwardi Centre - 8 

 

    GP PROFILE : UDAYPUR 

This GP started functioning   w. e f. 1959. This GP is geographically  bounded 
by Barbil GP in the east and Khuntapada GP in the West. Saharpada GP in the North, 
Silipada GP in the South. The Block Head Quarter is 6K.M. away from this GP.  All 
weather road communication is available to this GP headquarter.  

The Geographical and Demographic  feature  of the GP are as follows :         
1 Total Geographical area  : 2493.40 Hect.  
 Agricultural Area   : 1225 Hect.                                               
2. Total no. of Village   : 5 nos. 



3  Total no. of Wards   : 13 
4. Population as per 2011 census : 6429  

(a) Male    : 3194  49.68% 
(b) Female    : 3235  50.32% 
(c) S.C.    : 951     14.79% 
(d) S.T.    : 2210     34.38% 
(e) Others      : 3268     50.83% 

  5.  Literacy  :4035 (Male : 2306, Female : 1729) 
  6. Pry. School  - 5 
  7. High School  - 1 
  8. College  - 1 
  9. CHC   - 1 
  10. Anganwardi Centre - 5 
 

Brief Profiles of 22 GPs under Telkoi Block 
Akul  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Akul under Telkoi Block was established in 1992. It 
comprises of 6 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 854 nos. of Households out of which 627 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 3911 out of which 1919 are male 
and 1992 are female (Sex Ratio 1038). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 65% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-489, ST-2533 & Others-889. The literacy percentage of this GP is 67.27. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 11 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 4433.92 Acres. All the 6 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 72 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 9 nos. of GP Tanks, 20 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 9 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat and a 10 room 
market complex in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM 
Centre) is operational along with 6 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 6 nos. of 
ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 7 nos. of 
Primary School and 1 no. of High School are there. There are 5 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 3716 nos. of voters. In order to provide the 
subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 3 nos. of Mobile Towers 
are erected in this GP.  
Balabhadrapur  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Balabhadrapur under Telkoi Block was established in 
1953. It comprises of 9 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 12 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 941 nos. of Households out of which 
673 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4273 out of which 2082 are male 
and 2191 are female (Sex Ratio 1052). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 76% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-330, ST-3253 & Others-690. The literacy percentage of this GP is 46.52. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 35 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 7117.64 Acres. All the 7 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 74 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 13 nos. of GP Tanks, 2 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 



System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 12 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. To 
provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene 
to the local people, 2 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 7 
nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 9 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the 
GP. To strengthen the education system, 9 nos. of Primary School and 2 no. of High School 
are there. There are 6 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 4098 nos. 
of voters. In order to provide the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile 
connectivity, 1 no. of Mobile Tower is in this GP. 
 Bhimkand  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Bhimkand under Telkoi Block was established in 1971. 
It comprises of 5 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 782 nos. of Households out of which 587 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 3346 out of which 1659 are male 
and 1687 are female (Sex Ratio 1017). This GP is predominantly populated by General 
Caste people covering about 48% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-359, ST-1385 & Others-1602. The literacy percentage of this GP is 59. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 15 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 4873.48 Acres. All the 5 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 54 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 5 nos. of GP Tanks, 5 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 8 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM 
Centre) is operational along with 5 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 7 nos. of 
ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 6 nos. of 
Primary School and 1 no. of High School. There are 3 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling 
Booths in this GP with 1263 nos. of voters.  
Bimala  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Bimala under Telkoi Block was established in 1984. It 
comprises of 7 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 828 nos. of Households out of which 635 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 3714 out of which 1778 are male 
and 1936 are female (Sex Ratio 1089). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 63% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-426, ST-2328 & Others-960. The literacy percentage of this GP is 56.95. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 35 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 6469.16 Acres. All the 7 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 75 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 11 nos. of GP Tanks, 7 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 10 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat and a 5 room 
market complex in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM 
Centre) is operational along with 7 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 7 nos. of 
ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 10 nos. of 



Primary School and 1 no. of High School are there. There are 3 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 2429 nos. of voters. In order to provide the 
subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 1 nos. of Mobile Towers 
are erected in this GP.  
Binjhabahal  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Binjhabahal under Telkoi Block was established in 
1950. It comprises of 1 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 714 nos. of Households out of which 
555 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 3356 out of which 1686 are male 
and 1670 are female (Sex Ratio 991). This GP is predominantly populated by General Caste 
people covering about 60% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP is SC-
185, ST-1154 & Others-2017. The literacy percentage of this GP is 60.58. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 18 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 3831.80 Acres. All the 1 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 52 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 11 nos. of GP Tanks, 6 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 4 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM 
Centre) is operational along with 1 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 4 nos. of 
ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 6 nos. of 
Primary School and 1 no. of High School are there. There are 3 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 2288 nos. of voters. In order to provide the 
subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 3 nos. of Mobile Towers 
are erected in this GP. 
 Chhamunda  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Chhamunda under Telkoi Block was established in 
1967. It comprises of 3 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1189 nos. of Households out of 
which 864 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According 
to Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 5722 out of which 2874 are 
male and 2848 are female (Sex Ratio 991). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 61% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-402, ST-3455 & Others-1865. The literacy percentage of this GP is 62.20. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 8 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 6848.24 Acres. All the 3 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 86 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 12 nos. of GP Tanks, 3 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 2 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 7 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. To 
provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene 
to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 3 
nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 5 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the 
GP. To strengthen the education system, 13 nos. of Primary School and 2 nos. of High 
Schools are there. There are 4 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 
3839 nos. of voters. In order to provide the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted 
mobile connectivity, 3 nos. of Mobile Towers are erected in this GP. 

 



  
Deuladiha  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Deuladiha under Telkoi Block was established in 1970. 
It comprises of 6 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 13 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1341 nos. of Households out of which 910 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 5744 out of which 2922 are male 
and 2822 are female (Sex Ratio 966). This GP is predominantly populated by General Caste 
people covering about 41% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP is SC-
1229, ST-2198 & Others-2317. The literacy percentage of this GP is 61.96. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 7 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 6803.12 Acres. All the 6 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 60 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 6 nos. of GP Tanks, 5 nos. of Sanitary Wells functioning in this GP. To provide 
the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities and play school experience, there are 12 
nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the length and breadth of the GP. To provide 
the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene to the 
local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 6 nos. of 
Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 8 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To 
strengthen the education system, 8 nos. of Primary School and 1 no. of High School are 
there. There are 4 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 3147 nos. of 
voters. In order to provide the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile 
connectivity, 2 nos. of Mobile Towers are erected in this GP. 
 Dobalapal  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Dobalapal under Telkoi Block was established in 2001. 
It comprises of 4 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 636 nos. of Households out of which 471 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 2904 out of which 1494 are male 
and 1410 are female (Sex Ratio 944). This GP is predominantly populated by General Caste 
people covering about 53% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP is SC-
416, ST-952 & Others-1536. The literacy percentage of this GP is 67.15. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 6 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 3327.15 Acres. All the 4 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 47 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 8 nos. of GP Tanks, 7 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 3 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 5 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM 
Centre) is operational along with 4 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 4 nos. of 
ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 5 nos. of 
Primary School and 1 no. of High School are there. There are 2 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 2015 nos. of voters. In order to provide the 
subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 2 nos. of Mobile Towers 
are erected in this GP. 
 Jagamohanpur  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Jagamohanpur under Telkoi Block was established in 
1992. It comprises of 5 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1183 nos. of Households out of 
which 804 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According 



to Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 5101 out of which 2624 are 
male and 2477 are female (Sex Ratio 944). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 49% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-407, ST-2492 & Others-2192. The literacy percentage of this GP is 54.03. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 16 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 6146.90 Acres. All the 5 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 75 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 12 nos. of GP Tanks, 9 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 2 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 14 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat and a 11 room 
market complex in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 2 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM 
Centre) is operational along with 5 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 6 nos. of 
ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 7 nos. of 
Primary School and 1 no. of High School are there. There are 4 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 3233 nos. of voters. In order to provide the 
subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 4 nos. of Mobile Towers 
are erected in this GP. 
 Kaliahata  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Kaliahata under Telkoi Block was established in 1950. It 
comprises of 18 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 14 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1322 nos. of Households out of which 887 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 5683 out of which 2805 are male 
and 2878 are female (Sex Ratio 1026). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 70% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-573, ST-3958 & Others-1152. The literacy percentage of this GP is 38.94. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 40 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 9003.73 Acres. All the 12 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 74 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 12 nos. of GP Tanks, 13 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 18 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there are 2 nos. of weekly Hats in the 
GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and 
hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along 
with 15 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 19 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged 
in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 17 nos. of Primary School and 1 no. of High 
School & 1 no. of College are there. There are 5 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling 
Booths in this GP with 3297 nos. of voters.  
Karadangi  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Karadangi under Telkoi Block was established in 1983. 
It comprises of 7 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1151 nos. of Households out of which 810 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4541 out of which 2775 are male 
and 2854 are female (Sex Ratio 1028). This GP is predominantly populated by General 
Caste people covering about 52% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-843, ST-1126 & Others-2572. The literacy percentage of this GP is 58.93. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 21 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 



very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 9182.90 Acres. All the 6 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 48 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 17 nos. of GP Tanks, 3 nos. of Sanitary Wells are functioning in this GP. To 
provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities and play school experience, there 
are 14 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the length and breadth of the GP. To 
meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid 
medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical 
Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 5 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are 
formed and 11 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education 
system, 10 nos. of Primary School and 2 no. of High Schools are there. There are 4 nos. of 
Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 3101 nos. of voters. In order to provide 
the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 1 no. of Mobile Tower 
is erected in this GP. 
 Karamangi  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Karamangi under Telkoi Block was established in 1983. 
It comprises of 7 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 896 nos. of Households out of which 741 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4388 out of which 1973 are male 
and 2415 are female (Sex Ratio 1224). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 69% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-486, ST-2999 & Others-903. The literacy percentage of this GP is 59.69. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 20 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 6285.30 Acres. All the 6 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 55 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 12 nos. of GP Tanks, 5 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 14 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. To 
provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene 
to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 7 
nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 8 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the 
GP. To strengthen the education system, 14 nos. of Primary School and 3 no. of High 
Schools are there. There are 4 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 
2765 nos. of voters.  
Khuntapada  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Khuntapada under Telkoi Block was established in 
1962. It comprises of 6 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 12 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1433 nos. of Households out of 
which 974 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According 
to Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 5976 out of which 2900 are 
male and 3076 are female (Sex Ratio 1061). This GP is predominantly populated by 
Schedule Tribe people covering about 45% of the total population. The population statistics 
of this GP is SC-1120, ST-2636 & Others-2220. The literacy percentage of this GP is 53.38. 
The GP Headquarters is at a distance of around 4 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This 
GP is very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records 
of Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 6616.73 Acres. All the 6 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 80 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 10 nos. of GP Tanks, 11 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 12 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 



length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat and a 8 room 
market complex in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM 
Centre) is operational along with 6 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 7 nos. of 
ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 10 nos. of 
Primary School and 2 no. of High Schools are there. There are 8 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 5477 nos. of voters. In order to provide the 
subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 3 nos. of Mobile Towers 
are erected in this GP.  
Oriya Birida  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Oriya Birida under Telkoi Block was established in 
1984. It comprises of 8 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1054 nos. of Households out of 
which 730 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According 
to Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4631 out of which 2285 are 
male and 2346 are female (Sex Ratio 1027). This GP is predominantly populated by 
Schedule Tribe people covering about 56% of the total population. The population statistics 
of this GP is SC-479, ST-2582 & Others-1570. The literacy percentage of this GP is 51.76. 
The GP Headquarters is at a distance of around 5 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This 
GP is very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records 
of Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 10595.85 Acres. All the 8 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 60 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 10 nos. of GP Tanks, 7 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 2 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 11 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. To 
provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene 
to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 8 
nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 7 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the 
GP. To strengthen the education system, 10 nos. of Primary School and 1 no. of High School 
are there. There are 5 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 4610 nos. 
of voters. In order to provide the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile 
connectivity, 2 nos. of Mobile Towers are erected in this GP. 
Podang  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Podang under Telkoi Block was established in 1967. It 
comprises of 9 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 661 nos. of Households out of which 585 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 2795 out of which 1376 are male 
and 1419 are female (Sex Ratio 1031.25). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 64% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-288, ST-1775 & Others-732. The literacy percentage of this GP is 48.87. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 15 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 3806.93 Acres. All the 5 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 49 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 5 nos. of GP Tanks, 3 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 10 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is a 5 room market complex in 
the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health 
and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational 
along with 9 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 9 nos. of ASHA workers are 



engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 8 nos. of Primary School and 1 no. 
of High School. There are 2 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 
1363 nos. of voters.  
Purujoda  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Purujoda under Telkoi Block was established in 1991. It 
comprises of 6 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 950 nos. of Households out of which 735 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4459 out of which 2200 are male 
and 2259 are female (Sex Ratio 1027). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule 
Tribe people covering about 71% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP 
is SC-393, ST-3146 & Others-920. The literacy percentage of this GP is 47.16. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 30 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 6425.83 Acres. All the 6 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 51 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 12 nos. of GP Tanks, 13 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 13 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. To 
provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene 
to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 6 
nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 7 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the 
GP. To strengthen the education system, 6 nos. of Primary School and 2 no. of High School 
& 1 no. of College are there. There are 3 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this 
GP with 2522 nos. of voters. In order to provide the subscribers with seamless and 
uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 1 no. of Mobile Tower is erected in this GP. 
  
Raisuan  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Raisuan under Telkoi Block was established in 1953. It 
comprises of 7 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 964 nos. of Households out of which 522 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4922 out of which 2470 are male 
and 2452 are female (Sex Ratio 993). This GP is predominantly populated by Schedule Tribe 
people covering about 49% of the total population. The population statistics of this GP is SC-
232, ST-2404 & Others-2286. The literacy percentage of this GP is 63.88. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 35 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 10212.01 Acres. All the 6 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 75 nos. of 
Tube Wells, 19 nos. of GP Tanks, 5 nos. of Sanitary Wells functioning in this GP. To provide 
the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities and play school experience, there are 10 
nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the length and breadth of the GP. To meet 
the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid 
medical facility and awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical 
Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 6 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are 
formed and 7 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education 
system, 9 nos. of Primary School and 3 no. of High School are there. There are 6 nos. of 
Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 3944 nos. of voters. In order to provide 
the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 1 no. of Mobile Tower 
is erected in this GP. 
  



Saleikena  
The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Saleikena under Telkoi Block was established in 1984. 

It comprises of 6 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1153 nos. of Households out of 
which 894 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). 
According to Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 5344 out of which 
2670 are male and 2674 are female (Sex Ratio 1001). This GP is predominantly populated 
by Schedule Tribe people covering about 75% of the total population. The population 
statistics of this GP is SC-142, ST-4021 & Others-1181. The literacy percentage of this GP 
is 42.72. The GP Headquarters is at a distance of around 9 Kms. from the Block 
Headquarters. This GP is very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the 
Block. As per the records of Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 7682.56 Acres. All 
the 5 villages of the GP are electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily 
requirements, there are 56 nos. of Tube Wells, 5 nos. of GP Tanks, 8 nos. of Sanitary 
Wells functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 12 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through 
the length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. 
To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and 
hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along 
with 6 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 13 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged 
in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 7 nos. of Primary School and 1 no. of High 
School are there. There are 3 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 
2215 nos. of voters. In order to provide the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted 
mobile connectivity, 1 no. of Mobile Tower is erected in this GP.  
Sibanarayanpur Goda  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Sibanarayanpur Goda under Telkoi Block was 
established in 1967. It comprises of 10 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of 
Wards. As per 2011 Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1019 nos. of 
Households out of which 631 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 
survey). According to Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4528 out 
of which 2282 are male and 2246 are female (Sex Ratio 984). This GP is predominantly 
populated by Schedule Tribe people covering about 60% of the total population. The 
population statistics of this GP is SC-313, ST-2679 & Others-1536. The literacy percentage 
of this GP is 47.55. The GP Headquarters is at a distance of around 11 Kms. from the 
Block Headquarters. This GP is very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of 
the Block. As per the records of Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 5672.59 Acres. 
All the 9 villages of the GP are electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily 
requirements, there are 51 nos. of Tube Wells, 9 nos. of GP Tanks, 8 nos. of Sanitary 
Wells functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 12 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through 
the length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat in the GP. 
To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and awareness about health and 
hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along 
with 10 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 7 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged 
in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 10 nos. of Primary School and 1 no. of 
High School are there. There are 3 nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP 



with 2195 nos. of voters. In order to provide the subscribers with seamless and 
uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 2 nos. of Mobile Towers are erected in this GP.  
Sirigida  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Sirigida under Telkoi Block was established in 1949. It 
comprises of 5 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 822 nos. of Households out of which 594 
nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 3757 out of which 1851 are male 
and 1906 are female (Sex Ratio 1030). This GP is predominantly populated by General 
Caste people covering about 53% of the total population. The population statistics of this 
GP is SC-678, ST-1105 & Others-1974. The literacy percentage of this GP is 66.30. The 
GP Headquarters is at a distance of around 18 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP 
is very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 5352.11 Acres. All the 5 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 59 nos. 
of Tube Wells, 10 nos. of GP Tanks, 4 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water 
Supply System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School 
facilities and play school experience, there are 8 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning 
through the length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat 
and a 7 room market complex in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical 
facility and awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-
Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 5 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed 
and 7 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 6 
nos. of Primary School and 1 no. of High School are there. There are 4 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 2038 nos. of voters. In order to provide the 
subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 2 nos. of Mobile Towers 
are erected in this GP. 
Talapada  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Talapada under Telkoi Block was established in 1992. 
It comprises of 8 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 
Socio Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 588 nos. of Households out of 
which 481 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). 
According to Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 2769 out of which 
1375 are male and 1394 are female (Sex Ratio 1014). This GP is predominantly populated 
by Schedule Tribe people covering about 48% of the total population. The population 
statistics of this GP is SC-346, ST-1318 & Others-1105. The literacy percentage of this GP 
is 51.46. The GP Headquarters is at a distance of around 22 Kms. from the Block 
Headquarters. This GP is very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the 
Block. As per the records of Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 7511.10 Acres. All 
the 3 villages of the GP are electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily 
requirements, there are 36 nos. of Tube Wells, 9 nos. of GP Tanks, 2 nos. of Sanitary 
Wells functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School facilities 
and play school experience, there are 8 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning through the 
length and breadth of the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical facility and 
awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-Centre 
(ANM Centre) is operational along with 7 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed and 8 



nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 8 nos. 
of Primary School and 1 no. of High School are there. There are 2 nos. of Assembly 
Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 1773 nos. of voters.Telkoi  

The Gram Panchayat (GP) of Telkoi under Telkoi Block was established in 1950. It 
comprises of 6 nos. of Revenue Villages divided into 11 nos. of Wards. As per 2011 Socio 
Economic Caste Census (SECC), it has a total of 1161 nos. of Households out of which 
699 nos. of families are coming under BPL Category (As per 1997 survey). According to 
Population Census 2011, the total population of this GP is 4924 out of which 2620 are male 
and 2304 are female (Sex Ratio 879). This GP is predominantly populated by General 
Caste people covering about 65% of the total population. The population statistics of this 
GP is SC-785, ST-970 & Others-3169. The literacy percentage of this GP is 71.20. The GP 
Headquarters is at a distance of around 0 Kms. from the Block Headquarters. This GP is 
very well connected to the Block as well as other GPs of the Block. As per the records of 
Telkoi Tahasil, the total area of the GP is 2556.55 Acres. All the 5 villages of the GP are 
electrified. To provide people with water to meet their daily requirements, there are 50 nos. 
of Tube Wells, 8 nos. of GP Tanks, 7 nos. of Sanitary Wells and 1 no. of Pipe Water Supply 
System functioning in this GP. To provide the young kids of the GP with Pre-School 
facilities and play school experience, there are 8 nos. of Anganwadi Centres functioning 
through the length and breadth of the GP. To meet the local needs there is 1 weekly Hat 
and a 10 room market complex in the GP. To provide the much needed first aid medical 
facility and awareness about health and hygiene to the local people, 1 no. of Medical Sub-
Centre (ANM Centre) is operational along with 4 nos. of Gaon Kalyan Samities are formed 
and 9 nos. of ASHA workers are engaged in the GP. To strengthen the education system, 5 
nos. of Primary School and 2 no. of High School & 1 no. of College are there. There are 6 
nos. of Assembly Constitution Polling Booths in this GP with 3623 nos. of voters. In order to 
provide the subscribers with seamless and uninterrupted mobile connectivity, 5 nos. of 
Mobile Towers are erected in this GP.  

Harichandanpur Block  

MANOHARPUR G.P.Manoharpur G.P. under Harichandanpur Block is 3 km away from 
Block Headquarter. The total  nos of population is 5182 out of which ST 1412 SC 556 and 
others 3214 and house hold is 1483.There are 13 nos of revenue villages out of which 2 
nos are unhavitated with 15 nos of wards and 5 nos of polling station . Agriculture is the 
main source of livelihood of the villagers . The G.P. has 9 nos of Primary /Upper Primary 
school and 1 high school. The people depends on B.B. Mohavidyalaya H.C.Pur for higher 
education . There is one dispensary in the G.P. and people go to CHC Harichandanpur for 
health facilities . There are two mobile tower  for better communication purposes and 2 
villages is connected with pipe for drinking water supply. The G.P. has no sustainable water 
source it derivers very low income from its 31 ponds. 

JAMUJODI G.P.Jamujodi G.P. is under Harichandanpur Block . It is 7 km away from Block 
Headquarter . The total nos of population is 4264 out of which ST 1531 SC 484 and other 
2249 and house hold is 1127 .There are 9 nos of revenue villages and 5 nos of polling 
center. Agriculture is the main source iof livelihood of the villagers . The G.P. has 7 nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary School and 1 nos of high school. The villagers depends on CHC 
Harichandanpur for health facilities. There is one mobile tower for communication purposes  
and 2 nos of villages is connected with pipe for drinking water supply. The G.P. has no 



sustainable water source. It get slow income from its 21 nos of ponds. There is no well 
know festive occasion or tourist point in the G.P.  

BOXIBARIGAON G.P.Boxibarigaon G.P. under Harichandanpur Block . 25 kms  from 
Block Headquarter . The total population of the G.P. is 4156 (ST-2839,SC-353  and Other-
964). The main source of livelihood of the villagers agriculture and business . There are six 
(6) nos of revenue village will 12nos of words. The people have last access to education 
and health . The G.P. has 1 High School , 2 nos of Secondary School , 5 nos Primary 
School, 1 nos of Health center and 2 nos ANM Center . The  G.P. has one C.S.C center 
and one market. The G.P. has a famous makaramela at Dhanabeni village. There is a Siva 
Temple G.P. has 26nos of tube well and 14 nos of village pond ,25 nos C.C. Road and 28 
nos of Kachha Road , one Post Office , one R.I. Office. The area of the G.P. hasA.2.42 
Desmil (Khata no. 222, plot no.2289) . The G.P. has a good source of income from market 
G.P. houseand pokhari.  

THAKURAPADA G.P.Thakurapada  G.P. under Harichandanpur Block is 5 km from Block 
Headquarter .The total no of population of the G.P. 4297 (st-1745,sc-294 and Others -2258 
house hold-1181). The main source income of the villages are agriculture . There are 9 nos 
Revenue villages kith 12 nos of wards and 5 nos of polling center in the G.P. The People 
have easy access to education and health . The G.P. has 10 nos of Primary 5 nos of Upper 
Primary (M.E) School .There are 42 Tube well and no health center 15 nos of Aganwadi 
center.There is a lord Siva temple in front of our G.P. The G.P. has no own building and 
latrine. The villagers of the G.P observed all Hindu Festival. 

DAITARI G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 60 km from the block Headquarter . The total no 
of house hold of the G.P.is1043. Total population of the G.P.is 4065 out of which SC 
population is 693, ST 1496 and Others 1936. The G.P. has 1 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 13 wards. There are 2 Primary School ,1  High School , 1 CHC, 5 AWC, 2 
ANM center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 2 nos of Tanks, 1 Hat.  
internal source of G.P. income 

RASOL G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 30 km from the block Headquarter . The total no of 
house hold of the G.P.is1640. Total population of the G.P.is 7518 out of which SC 
population is 710, ST 5155 and Others 1562. The G.P. has 11 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 14 wards. There are 8 Primary School ,1  High School , 12 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 2 nos of Tanks, 1 Hat.  2 
Marketing complex for internal source of G.P. income. 

PITAPITI G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 8 km from the block Headquarter . The total no of 
house hold of the G.P.is636. Total population of the G.P.is 2586 out of which SC population 
is 351, ST 780 and Others 1455. The G.P. has 5 no of Revenue villagers consisting of 11 
wards. There are 4 Primary School ,1  High School , 8 AWC, 1 ANM center in the G.P. The 
main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied activities . The G.P has 
good communication facility. There are 10 nos of tanks. 3 kaina , 2 Bagayat and no market  
complex for internal source of G.P. income. 



BADAPALASPAL G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 15 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1485. Total population of the G.P.is 6477 out of which 
SC population is 722, ST 3398 and Others 2357. The G.P. has 10 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 15 wards. There are 10 Primary School ,1  High School , 15 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 12 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 5 
kaina, 6 Bagayat and no market  complex for internal source of G.P. income. 

TANGIRIAPAL G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 25 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1154. Total population of the G.P.is 5454 out of which 
SC population is 56, ST 4966 and Others 432. The G.P. has 8 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 8 Primary School ,1  High School , 10 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 18 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 3 
kaina, 2 Bagayat and market  complex for internal source of G.P. income. 

DHORADIAMBA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 10 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1468. Total population of the G.P.is 6920 out of which 
SC population is 143, ST 5145 and Others 1632. The G.P. has 6 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 13 wards. There are 10 Primary School ,1  High School , 13 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 25 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 4 
kaina, 3 Bagayat and market  complex for internal source of G.P. income. 

BOREIGODA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 22 km from the block Headquarter . The total 
no of house hold of the G.P.is 1166. Total population of the G.P.is 5378 out of which SC 
population is 35, ST 4333 and Others 1010. The G.P. has 14 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 8 Primary School ,1  High School , 16 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has not good communication facility. There are 8 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 1 
kaina, 2 Bagayat and no market  complex for internal source of G.P. income. 

SUNAPENTH G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 8 km from the block Headquarter . The total 
no of house hold of the G.P.is 1921. Total population of the G.P.is 8426 out of which SC 
population is 670, ST 4402 and Others 3354. The G.P. has 8 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 14 wards and 6 nos polling station. There are 10 Primary School ,1  High 
School , 12 AWC, 2 ANM center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is 
agriculture and allied activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 18 
nos of tanks, 2 kaina, 4 Bagayat and no market  complex for internal source of G.P. 
income. 

JIRANG G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 15 km from the block Headquarter . The total no of 
house hold of the G.P.is 1005. Total population of the G.P.is 4165 out of which SC 
population is 421, ST 1690 and Others 2054. The G.P. has 8 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards and 4 nos polling station. There are 8 Primary School ,1  High 
School , 10 AWC, 1 ANM center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is 
agriculture and allied activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 2 nos 



of Mobile Towers and 3 nos Bus stop for better communication purposes. 18 nos of tanks, 
2 kaina, for internal source of G.P. income. 

BUDHAKHAMAN G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 22 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 936. Total population of the G.P.is 3995 out of which 
SC population is 66, ST 2675 and Others 1254. The G.P. has 5 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards and 4 nos polling station. There are 4 Primary School ,1 nos of 
CHC, 1  High School , 6AWC, 1 ANM center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of 
the people is agriculture and allied activities . The G.P has good communication facility. 
There are 8 nos of tanks, 2 kaina, 5 nos of Bagayat for internal source of G.P. income. 

SAGADAPATA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 18 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1516. Total population of the G.P.is 7349 out of which 
SC population is 346, ST 5990 and Others 1013. The G.P. has 6 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 15 wards. There are 5 Primary School , 1  High School , 12 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 11 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 
There are 3 kaina, 2 nos of Bagayat for internal source of G.P. income. 

TENTALAPOSI G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 30 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1696. Total population of the G.P.is 7343 out of which 
SC population is 305, ST 3344 and Others 3694. The G.P. has 14 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 15 wards. There are 12 Primary School , 1  High School , 18 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 10 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 
There are 3 kaina, 5 nos of Bagayat and 2 nos of Market Complex for internal source of 
G.P. income. 

JUNGA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 30 km from the block Headquarter . The total no of 
house hold of the G.P.is 1397. Total population of the G.P.is 5872 out of which SC 
population is 381, ST 3225 and Others 2266. The G.P. has 12 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 10 Primary School , 1  High School , 9 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 13 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 
There are 2 kaina, 4 nos of Bagayat and 1 nos of Market Complex for internal source of 
G.P. income. 

JANGHIRA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 28 km from the block Headquarter . The total 
no of house hold of the G.P.is 1088. Total population of the G.P.is 4607 out of which SC 
population is 406, ST 1909 and Others 2292. The G.P. has 7 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 7 Primary School , 1 CHC, 1  High School , 10 AWC, 2 
ANM center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 10 nos of tanks, 1 Hat. 
There are 3 kaina, 8 nos of Bagayat and 3 nos of Market Complex for internal source of 
G.P. income. 

HUNDA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 20 km from the block Headquarter . The total no of 
house hold of the G.P.is 1427. Total population of the G.P.is 5974 out of which SC 



population is 573, ST 3182 and Others 2219. The G.P. has 7 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 6 Primary School , 1  High School , 8 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 6 nos of tanks. There are 
4kaina, 5 nos of Bagayat for internal source of G.P. income. 

GOUNIGHASA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 25 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1177. Total population of the G.P.is 4803 out of which 
SC population is 368, ST 3029 and Others 1406. The G.P. has 4 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 4 Primary School , 1  High School , 8 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 9 nos of tanks. There are 2 
kaina, 2 nos of Market Complex for internal source of G.P. income. 

BHAGAMUNDA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 16 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1572. Total population of the G.P.is 7117 out of which 
SC population is 647, ST 4448 and Others 2022. The G.P. has 4 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 4 Primary School , 1  High School ,1 CHC,  5 AWC, 1 
ANM center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 13 nos of tanks, 1 nos Hat. 
There are 3 kaina, 5 nos of Bagayat, 2 nos of Market Complex for internal source of G.P. 
income. 

BHAWNARPUR G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 12 km from the block Headquarter . The 
total no of house hold of the G.P.is 928. Total population of the G.P.is 3900 out of which 
SC population is 66, ST 2675  and Others 1254. The G.P. has 6 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 12 wards. There are 6 Primary School , 6  High School , 10 AWC, 1 ANM 
center in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture and allied 
activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 8 nos of tanks, 1 nos Hat. 
There are 5 kaina, 3 nos of Bagayat, no Market Complex for internal source of G.P. 
income. 

HARICHANDANPUR G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 0.0 km from the block Headquarter . 
The total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1704. Total population of the G.P.is 7434 out of 
which SC population is 457, ST 2477  and Others 4500. The G.P. has 6 no of Revenue 
villagers consisting of 11 wards. There are 6 Primary School , 2  High School ,1 CHC,  10 
AWC, 2 ANM center ,1 College in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is 
agriculture and allied activities . The G.P has good communication facility. There are 21 
nos of tanks, 1 nos Hat. There are 3 kaina, 5 nos of Bagayat, 5 nos of  Market Complex for 
internal source of G.P. income. 

REVANAPALASPAL G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 25 km from the block Headquarter . 
The total no of house hold of the G.P.is 1305. Total population of the G.P.is 6001 out of 
which SC population is 192, ST 4397  and Others 1412. The G.P. has 7 no of Revenue 
villagers consisting of 12 wards. There are 7 Primary School , 1  High School ,1 PHC,  9 
AWC, 2 ANM center , in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the people is agriculture 
and allied activities . The G.P has no good communication facility. There are 7 nos of tanks, 



1 nos Hat. There are 3 kaina, 2 nos of Bagayat, 1 nos of  Market Complex for internal 
source of G.P. income. 

PITHAGOLA G.P.The distance of the G.P. is 25 km from the block Headquarter . The total 
no of house hold of the G.P.is 3994. Total population of the G.P.is 7370 out of which SC 
population is 633, ST 3684  and Others 3053. The G.P. has 12 no of Revenue villagers 
consisting of 17 wards. There are 5 nos of Polling Station,  12 Primary School ,3 noa of 
Upper Primary School,  2  High School ,2 nos of Mobile Towers for better communication,1 
nos of PHC,  12 AWC, 3 ANM center , in the G.P. The main source of livelihood of the 
people is agriculture and allied activities . The G.P has no good communication facility. 
There are 7 nos of tanks, 1 nos Hat. There are 3 kaina, 2 nos of Bagayat, 1 nos of  Market 
Complex for internal source of G.P. income. 

PROFILE OF BANSPAL BLOCK 

Banspal Block is functioning  since 1960. Total Block area is 1103.78 Sq. KMs  
comprising of 21 G.P.s, the Block comprising with Hills Judia Ghati end with mountain 
Sanghagara having some    creeks    rivers and water fall in between. The scenic beauty 
of Banspal is full of hills and plateaus.   

The river Baitarani origins from Gonasika hill and creeks and wades below the 
Block headquarters  Machhandana MIP has been constructed near Medinipur & 
Dangapani village on Machhakandana Nallah. Total 21 Grama Panchayat comprising with 
164 villages and 260 wards having 17086 house holds. Population of Block consist 85133 
out of which 3585 nos. of Schedule Tribes, 66829 nos. of Schedule Caste  and 14720 
Other Caste. Total BPL Family as per the approved list is 17086. There are 5 nos. of 
Financial institution are functioning under the jurisdiction of Banspal Block like 3 nos. of 
OGB & 2 nos. of BOI. The Gandhanmardan Mountain is a major source of Iron Ores 
where OMC is now extracting Iron Ores from this ranges. Major category of  S.T. people 
are residing here since long specially primitive Tribes like Juanga people are staying in 6 
G.P.s 

  The position of educational institutions functioning in this block are indicated. 

1. Pry. School   157 
2. Upper Pry. School    42 
3. High School     24 
4. Ashram School    02 
5. SevaShram School    04 
6. Residential School    03 
7. Residential H/s    05 
8. College     01 

  Some tourist places are found in the Block area like-Sanghagara water fall near 
Anjor & Judia ghat, Gupta Ganga, the origin of famous river Baitarani, Ancient Lord Siva 
Temple at Gonasika, Khandhadhar  Water Fall near Kadalkala, Badaghagara water Fall 
and Sanmachhakandana MIP,  Rakam ( Khandadhar-II) water Fall and Nimdeuli water fall 
near Champajhar. Paddy is the major crop in this locality. 



The Arden Plant is functioning in Fuljhar G.P. since 2000. People of that 
locality are getting their livelihood from that Plant. 

BANSPAL G.P.Banspal  G.P. under Banspal Block is 03 K.M.  from Block Headquarter. It 
is established in the year,1966. The population if the G.P. is 5430 consisting of 2612 male 
and 2818 Female. Total house hold of the G.P. is 1147. The main sources of livelihood of 
the villagers are Agriculture. There are 06. Nos. of Revenue villages of the G.P. divided in 
to 13 nos. of wards, people of the G.P. are getting  good health and education facilities. 
Most of the Tribal people are residing here. Different type of Govt. Progremme is 
implemented smoothly. There is a big weekly Hat running every Thursday with the 
guidance of RMC. G.P. is getting Revenue from RMC. There is no other income sources of 
the G.P. One tribal leader namely-Ratnakar Nayak born in village- Rugudisahi of Banspal 
and led the tribal of the locality against the exploitation of the then rulers in 19th Century. 

JATRA G.PJatra G.P. under Banspal Block is 9 K.M. from Block Headquarter. It is 
established in the year,1966. The population of the G.P. is around 4821 consisting of 2360 
nos. of male and 2461 nos. of Female. The total house hold is 995. Most of the people are 
depend on Agriculture. There are 06 nos. of Revenue villages consisting of 13 nos. of 
wards. There is good Health & Education facilities in the G.P. the income source is from 
market complex & other Public Properties. The communication from Block headquarter to 
G.P. is PMGSY Road continuing up to Kadakala. 

KALANDA G.P.Kalanda G.P. under Banspal Block is 15 K.M. from Block Headquarter. It is 
established in the year,2001. The population of the GP is around 3593. Consisting of 1742 
nos. of male and 1851 nos. of Female divided into 11 nos. of words. Total house hold is 
747. Most of the people are depend upon Agriculture. Total 08 nos. of Revenue villages 
under this G.P. people are getting good health and Education facilities. There is no other 
source of income of the G.P. Different type of Development  Work  implemented regularly, 
hence people are getting their livelihood from these sources. There is one PHC are getting 
Health facilities from PHC.  

KUMUNDI G.P.Kumundi  G.P. under Banspal Block is 7 K.M. from Block Headquarter. It is 
established in the year,1966. Total 6868 nos. of people are residing in this G.P. consisting 
of 3382 nos. of Male and 3486 nos. of Female. 05 nos. of revenue village divided into 12 
wards. Total house hold is 1519. People are depend upon on agriculture. Different type of 
Development work implemented time to time for betterment of the people. Water supply 
facility is available in G.P. headquarter.  

BAYAKUMUTIA G.P.Bayakumutia G.P. under Banspal Block is 18 K.M. from Block Head 
quarter. It is established in the year,1971. It stands on the Road side of N.H-49. There are 
8 nos. of village divided into 11 wards. The main source of livelihood of the G.P. is 
Agriculture. There is no other source of income of the G.P. Total 2217 nos. of people are 
residing in the G.P. consisting of 196 Male and 2021 Female. There is one OGB Bank. 
People are getting loan from this Bank. 23 nos. of SHG functioning in this G.P. Main source 
of income in this GP is Agriculture. Total house hold is 857. 

TALACHEMPEI G.P.Talachempei GP under Banspal Block is 19 K.M. from Block 
headquarter. The communication of this G.P. to Block is NH-49 and PMGSY  Road. 13 



nos. of villages divided into 11 word. Main source of income is from agriculture. The G.P.  is 
established in the year,1984. The total 4596 people are residing in this G.P. consisting of 
2261 Male and 2325 Female. There is no good Health and Education facilities. There is no 
source of income of the G.P. total house hold is 979. 

TALAKAINSIARI G.P.Talakainsiari G.P. under Banspal Block is 20 K.M. from Block 
Headquarter. It is established in the year,2001.  There are 6 nos. of Revenue villages of the 
G.P. The total population of the G.P. is 2543. Consisting of 1392 nos. of Male and 1152 
nos. of Female divided into 11 wards. It is under OMC (Putulpani Mines). Most of the 
people depend on mines. There is no source of income of the G.P. The GP is  famous for 
Sanghagara Water Fall, but now it is under Sub-collector, Keonjhar. Thousands of people 
are coming every year to this place to observe the scenic  beauty of the fall and area of this 
place. It is a  very good Picnic spot. People are getting good Medical and education 
facilities under Suakati OMC. Total house hold is 569. 

 UPPER RAIGODA G.P.Upper  Raigoda GP under Banspal Block is 15 K.M. from Block 
headquarter. It is established in the year,1967. Total 4033 people are residing in this G.P. 
consisting of 1967 Male and 3875 Female divided into 16 ward. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers is Agriculture.  There are 11 nos. of Revenue villages in this G.P. 
there is no Health and education facilities. There is also no income source of the G.P.  
Different type of Development work implementing by Block and other Department time to 
time. Total house hold of the G.P. is 1657. 

KUANAR G.P.Kuanr G.P. under Banspal Block is 14 K.M. from Block headquarter. It is 
established in the year,1966. Total 9 nos. of village in the G.P. divided into 11 ward. The 
population of the G.P. is 6019 consisting on 2873 Male and 3146 Female. People are 
depend upon on Agriculture and daily labour.  There is one govt. Orchard, special famous 
for different type of mango. The G.P.  is stand near by N.H-49.  There is no other source of 
income of the G.P. Total house hold is 1220. 

NAYAKOTE G.P.Nayakote G.P. under Banspal Block is 15 K.M. from Block headquarter. It 
is established in the year,1971. Total population of the G.P. is 3661 divided into 11 wards. 
There are 6 nos. of villages in the G.P. The communication from the GP headquarter to 
Block is very convenient. There is one Police Station. The people are depend upon 
Agriculture. People are getting good Health and Education facilities. Total house hold of the 
G.P. is 805. 

KADAKALA GPKadakala GP under Banspal Block is 25 KM from Block headquarter . It is 
established on 1971. There are 9 nos. of village in the GP . Total population of the GP 6898 
divided into 13 wards consisting of 3407 male and 3491 female. Main source of income is 
from agriculture . There is a very beautiful picnic sport called Khandadhar. Thousand of 
people are coming ti this picnic sport every year . But GP is not taking any interest  to 
collect entertainment  tax. It is one of the better income source of the GP . There are some 
market and one weekly hat in the GP. Total house hold of the GP is 1363. 

 



KARANGADIHI GP Karangadihi GP under Banspal Block is 7 KM from Block headquarter . 
It is established in the year 1971. There are 7 nos. of villages in the GP  divided into 11 
wards. The area of the GP is 49 Sq.km. The population of the GP is 3237 consisting of 
1654 male and 3237 female. Main source of income is from agriculture . The people are 
getting better health and education facilities. Different type of Govt. programme is 
implemented in the GP . People are getting their source of income form development work 
in their area. Total house hold of the GP is 669.  

SINGHPUR G.P.Singhpur G.P. under Banspal Block is  20 K.M. from Block headquarter. It 
is established in the year,1967. There are 9 village in the G.P. divided into 13 wards. Total 
population of the G.P. is 5124 consisting 2516 male and 2608 Female. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers is Agriculture. The People are getting better Health and Education 
facilities. Total house hold of the G.P. is 1086. 

BARAGARH G.P.Baragarh G.P. under Banspal Block is 30 K.M.  from Block headquarter. 
The G.P. is established in the year,1992. There are 11 villages in the G.P. divided into 12 
wards. Total population of the G.P. is 2934. Consisting 1469 Male and 2437 Female. Most 
of the people belongs to labour. One PHC is functioning in G.P. headquarter. People are 
getting Health facilities from that PHC. Education facilities is not so        . Though 
agriculture is the main base of the villagers still they are depend upon on other 
development work implementing as GP area time to time. Total house hold of the G.P. is 
795. 

GONASIKA GP Gonasika GP under Banspal Block is 20 KM from Block Headquarter. The 
GP is established in 1966. Total 10 Nos. of villagers in the GP divided into 12 wards. The 
population of the GP is 4668 consisting 2427 male and 2241 female , one PHC is running 
in GP Head quarter . people are getting better medical facilities from that PHC, Better 
education facilities is also available. Gonasika GP is famous for Gupta Ganga starting 
source of river Baitarani and oldest lord shiv temple in village Gonasika which is functioning 
under endowment department . The main source of livelihood of the villagers is agriculture 
most of people are labour class. Total house hold is 893. 

SUAKATI GP  Suakati GP under Banspal Block is 12 KM  from Block Headquarter . The 
GP is established in 1958. Total 6 nos. villages in the GP divided in to 15 wards. Total 
population of the GP is 7535 consisting 3610 male and 3925 female. It is a important place 
of education and health people are getting better education and health facilities. The area 
of the GP is 0.950 Hector . GP is famous for Tarini Temple and Lord Pateswar Shiv Mandir 
. OMC office is located in GP head quarter . Most of the people depend on mining , 
Agriculture is the main profession of the village people . Total house hold of the GP is 1546. 

KODIPASA GP Kodipasa GP under Banspal Block is 40 KM. from Block Head quarter. It is 
established in  the year 1966. Total 9 nos. of  villages coming under the GP  divided into 12 
wards . The population of the GP is 3522 consisting on 1774 male and 1748 female. The 
main source of livelihood of the villagers is Agriculture . Total house hold of the GP is 722. 

SAHARPUR    Saharpur GP is the Block Head quarter GP. It is established in 1966 
consisting of 7nos. of  villages  divided into 15 wards . There is one CHC , People are 
getting better medical facilities from that CHC , Main source of livelihood of the villagers is 



agriculture. Main sources of income of the GP from market complex and daily market . 
Total population of the GP is 5214 consisting of 2627 male and 2587 female. The river 
Baitarani is flowing nearly Saharpur . Total house hold of the GP is 1079 .  

FULJHAR GP  Fuljhar GP under Banspal Block is 25 KM from Block head quarter . It is 
established in the year 1971 consisting of 8 nos. of villages divided into 14 wards. There is 
one PHC, People are getting better health facilities . The main source of livelihood of the 
villagers is agriculture . There is no internal source of income in the GP . Total house hold 
of the GP is 1189. 

TARAMAKANTA GP   Taramakanta GP under Banspal Block is 16 KM  from Block head 
quarter . It is established in the year 1971. Total 4430 people are  residing in thye GP  
consisting of 2229 male and 2201 female . Main source of income is agriculture . The 
people of the GP are getting better health and education facilities . There is a weekly hat at 
GP head quarter . Source of income is very poor. Total revenue villages of the GP is 10 
and total house hold is 1006. 

TANA GP  Tana GP is under Banspal Block is 50 KM from Block head quarter . GP is 
established in 1971. Total population of the GP is  3428 divided into 11 wards consisting of 
2101 male and 2157 female. Total house hold of the GP is 885 and total revenue villages in 
the GP is 7.        

CHAMPUA BLOCK 

 Champua Panchayat Samiti, of Keonjhar District, which is situated 55 KM away from the 
District HQ was established on 01/10/1953 having 144 no revenue villages extended in 
475.579 Sqr Km Geographical area. The total population of Block as per census held 
during 2011 is 98,185 out of which ST community comprises 46325 and SC 9316 nos. Rest 
46325 belongs to others community. The Block is having 22 no of Gram Panchayats and 
263 no of wards. The block has total 212 no of schools out of which 116 primery  schools, 
nodal schools 62 nos,,34  no of high schools. There are 4 no colleges existing in this Block. 
For public health there is one community health center , PHC 3 nos, total dispensaries  17 
nos out of which allopathic 6 nos, ayurvedic 7 nos and homoeopathic dispensaries 4 nos 
&34 no of ANM centers. 199 no of AWCs are present under ICDS. All 144 no of villages 
have been electrified and 28 no villages provided with water supply systems. 1167 no of 
tube wells are running in this Block. There are 369 no of tanks are present. 23 no of weekly 
markets are managed by the GPs of Champua Block.  

It has total 756 km of GP road, 144 km PS road, 152 km CC road.  The block has 34 no of 
post offices, 3 no of nationalized banks, 5 no of RRBs and one KCCB. Tatal 1051 no of self 
help groups have been registered in block. One police station and one out station is also 
present. Total 9482 no of beneficiaries are getting monthly pension under old age, widow 
and disable pension schemes. 7 no of disable persons have been rehabilitiated by DRI 
loans.. 

GP PROFILE OF - JAMUDALAK 

Jamudalak grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 10 km far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1955 having 07 numbers of revenue villages. 



The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   5402 out of which 2958 numbers of 
st, 349 s numbers of sc and 3609 numbers of oc are living. Total bpl hh is 833. The gp has 
06 numbers of primary school 01 numbers of upper primary school and 01 numbers of high 
school including 09 numbers of awc for easy access to education. 

There are 63 numbers of tubewell & 14 numbers of village pond, 03 numbers of play 
ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 57 numbers of shg groups have been formed. for 
financial transaction and for communication 02 post office is established in this gp.Under 
social security scheme mbpy-190, ignoap- 186     , igndp-     09   odp-   58 and ignwp -81 
beneficiaries are getting pension.02 numbers of temple are constructed in our GP. 

Festival occasions: Raja Parva And Makar Sankranti, Durga Puja, Laxmi Puja are main 
festival of this GP.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are 
depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF - KODAGADIA 

Kodagadia grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 12 km far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1967 having 06 numbers of revenue villages. 
The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   4291 out of which st 2472 sc 289  
oc-1530  . Total bpl hh is 634. The gp has 04 numbers of primary school 02 numbers of 
upper primary school and 01 numbers of high school including 09 numbers of awc for easy 
access to education. 

There are 65 numbers of tubewell, 00 numbers of village tank & 10 numbers of 
village pond, 03 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 15 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed. for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-206, ignoap- 168     , igndp-     
01   odp-   30 and ignwp -37 beneficiaries are getting pension.03 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our GP.Raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi puja are main 
festival of this GP.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are 
depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – CHANDRASEKHAR PUR 

Chandrasekhar Pur grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 17 km far 
from the block head quarter. It was established on 20.10.200 having 08 numbers of 
revenue villages. The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   3303 out of which  
st 1863 sc 82  oc-1358  . Total bpl hh is 645. The gp has 02 numbers of primary school 07 
numbers of upper primary school and 01 numbers of high school including 06 numbers of 
awc for easy access to education.There are 72 numbers of tubewell, 10 numbers of village 
tank & 11 numbers of village pond, 02 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better 
livlyhood 20 numbers of shg groups have been formed. for financial transaction and for 
communication 01 post office is established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-
126, ignoap- 99, igndp-03odp-32 and ignwp -42 beneficiaries are getting pension.01 
numbers of temple are constructed in our gp.Raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, 
laxmi puja are main festival of this gp.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of 
villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.  



GP PROFILE OF – SAREI 

Sarei grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 10 km far from the 
block head quarter. It was established on 1997 having 04 numbers of revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   3610 out of which st -1841 sc 
-708 and oc-1061. Total bpl hh is 516. The gp has 04 numbers of primary school 00 
numbers of upper primary school and 01 numbers of high school including 06 numbers of 
awc for easy access to education.There are 60 numbers of tubewell, 22 numbers of village 
tank & 02 numbers of village pond, 02 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better 
livlyhood 44 numbers of shg groups have been formed. For financial transaction and for 
communication 01 post office is established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-
166, ignoap- 113     , igndp-     00   odp-   26 and ignwp -31 beneficiaries are getting 
pension.01 numbers of temple are constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and 
makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda 
the famous place celebrates yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of 
villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – KALIKAPRASAD 

Kalikaprasad grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 12 km far 
from the block head quarter. It was established on 06/12/1949 having 04 numbers of 
revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   5747 out of which st -1904 sc 
-804 and oc-3039. Total bpl hh is 744. The gp has 04 numbers of primary school and 02 
numbers of high school including 09 numbers of awc for easy access to education. 

There are 54 numbers of tubewell, 19 numbers of village tank & 12 numbers of 
village pond, 04 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 72 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 02 post office is 
established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-155, ignoap- 193     , igndp-     05   
odp-   36 and ignwp -21 beneficiaries are getting pension.07 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – BADANAI 

Badanai grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 10 km far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1984 having 07 numbers of revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   5611 out of which st -2551 sc 
-321 and oc-2739. Total bpl hh is 837 the gp has 07 numbers of primary school , up-01 and 
01 numbers of high school including 12 numbers of awc for easy access to education. 

There are 70 numbers of tubewell, 18 numbers of village tank & 02 numbers of 
village pond, 03 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 60 numbers of shg 



groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-194, ignoap- 133     , igndp-     14   
odp-30 and ignwp -107 beneficiaries are getting pension.03 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season.  

Gp profile of – rangamatia 

Rangamatia grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 24 kms far 
from the block head quarter. It was established on 1964 having 08 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   5754 out of which st -3033 sc 
-442 and oc-1279. Total bpl hh is 990 the gp has 07 numbers of primary school , up-03 and 
03 numbers of high school including 09 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 77 numbers of tubewell, 26 numbers of village tank & 03 numbers of 
village pond, 05 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 48 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 03 post office is 
established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-215, ignoap- 171     , igndp-     00   
odp-   35 and ignwp -31 beneficiaries are getting pension. 02 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season.  

Gp profile of – uchabali 

Uchabali grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 30 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 25/03/1992 having 08 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   4343 out of which st -2419 sc 
-207 and oc-1717. Total bpl hh is 727 the gp has 07 numbers of primary school , up-00 and 
02 numbers of high school including 08 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 68 numbers of tubewell, 06 numbers of village tank & 06 numbers of 
village pond, 03 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 34 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 03 post office is 
established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-176, ignoap- 127     , igndp-     02   
odp-   59 and ignwp -59 beneficiaries are getting pension.03 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season.  

 

 



GP profile of – Bhuinpur 

Bhuinpur grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 27 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1955 having 08 numbers of revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   6945 out of which st -1834 sc 
-370 and oc-4741. Total bpl hh is 762 the gp has 07 numbers of primary school , up-04 and 
03 numbers of high school including 07 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 73 numbers of tubewell, 05 numbers of village tank & 25 numbers of 
village pond, 02 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 45 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 02 post office is 
established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-274, ignoap- 198    , igndp-     14  
odp-   53 and ignwp -27  beneficiaries are getting pension.04 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season.  

Gp profile of – kutariposi 

Kutariposi  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 15 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 01/01/2002 having 05 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   2565 out of which st -959 sc -
247 and oc-1359  total bpl hh is 576 the gp has 05 numbers of primary school , up-00 and 
01 numbers of high school including 05 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 68 numbers of tubewell, 07 numbers of village tank & 03  numbers of 
village pond, 01 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 12 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed. for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-132,  ignoap- 33   , igndp-     09  
odp-   29 and ignwp -35 beneficiaries are getting pension.01 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – RIMULI 

Rimuli  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 12 kms far from the 
block head quarter. It was established on 02/07/1967 having 03 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   6338 out of which st -2390 sc 
-1150 and oc-2798  total bpl hh is 600 the gp has 06 numbers of primary school , up-00 
and 01 numbers of high school including 09 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 59 numbers of tubewell, 00 numbers of village tank & 22  numbers of 
village pond, 03 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 74 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  For financial transaction and for communication 02 post office is 



established in this gp. One ogb and one boi bank is in this gp.Under social security scheme 
mbpy-,284  ignoap- 221    , igndp-     04   odp- 45   and ignwp -28  beneficiaries are getting 
pension.02 numbers of temple are constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and 
makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda 
the famous place celebrates yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of 
villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – JYOTIPUR 

Jyotipur  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 35 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 06/04/1992 having 04 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   3227 out of which st -950 sc -
1031 and oc-1246  total bpl hh is 508 the gp has 04 numbers of primary school , up-00 and 
02 numbers of high school including 07 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 51 numbers of tubewell, 07 numbers of village tank & 06  numbers of 
village pond, 01 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 20 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp. Ogb bank is also established for financial transaction.Under social 
security scheme mbpy-154,  ignoap- 44   , igndp-     03  odp-   00 and ignwp -94 
beneficiaries are getting pension. 01 numbers of temple are constructed in our gp.Festival 
occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi puja are main festival of this 
gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates yearly.The main sourse of 
livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on business during non-
agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF –JAJAPOSI 

Jajaposi  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 40 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 10/10/1983 having 07 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   4163 out of which st -2190 sc 
-450 and oc-1523 total bpl hh is 757 the gp has 06 numbers of primary school , up-00 and 
03  numbers of high school including 11 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 71 numbers of tubewell, 06 numbers of village tank & 15  numbers of 
village pond, 02 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 24 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 02 post office is 
established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-253,  ignoap- 117   , igndp-     03  
odp-   42and ignwp -61 beneficiaries are getting pension.02 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season.  

 

 



GP PROFILE OF – PARSALA 

Parsala  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 16 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1984  having 06 numbers of revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   2954 out of which st -766 sc -
283 and oc-1905  total bpl hh is 479 the gp has 04 numbers of primary school , up-01 and 
01 numbers of high school including 05 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 35 numbers of tubewell, 08 numbers of village tank & 01  numbers of 
village pond, 03 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 27 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-103,  ignoap- 110   , igndp-     
012  odp-   29 and ignwp -39 beneficiaries are getting pension.01 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. In makar keshari kunda the famous place celebrates 
yearly.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on 
business during non-agricultural season. 

GP PROFILE OF – SUNAPOSI 

Sunaposi  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 12 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 20/10/2000  having 08 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   4824 out of which st -1923 sc 
-421 and oc-2480  total bpl hh is 817 the gp has 08 numbers of primary school , up-01 and 
01 numbers of high school including 012 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 95 numbers of tubewell, 15 numbers of village tank & 03  numbers of 
village pond, 06 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 25 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-257,  ignoap- 181   , igndp-     01  
odp-   39 and ignwp -40 beneficiaries are getting pension.01 numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of 
villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season. 

GP PROFILE OF – SADANGI 

Sadangi  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 42 kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1966  having 04 numbers of revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse    is 2677 out of which st -1249 
sc -21 and oc-1407  total bpl hh is 387 the gp has 02 numbers of primary school , up-02 
and 02 numbers of high school.college 01  including 05 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 48 numbers of tubewell, 05 numbers of village tank & 010  numbers of 
village pond, 03 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 19 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 02 post office is 
established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-139,  ignoap- 75   , igndp-     01  
odp-   32 and ignwp -22 beneficiaries are getting pension.05 numbers of temple are 



constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of 
villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – JALLY 

Jally  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 35  kms far from the 
block head quarter. It was established on 28/06/1992  having 06 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   3602 out of which st -2498 sc 
-399 and oc-718  total bpl hh is 559 the gp has 07 numbers of primary school , up-01 and 
02 numbers of high school including 08 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 59 numbers of tubewell, 6 numbers of village tank & 06  numbers of 
village pond, 02 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 18 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-140,  ignoap- 207   , igndp-     01  
odp-  22 and ignwp -11 beneficiaries are getting pension.02  numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of 
villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – KARANJIA 

Karanjia  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 15  kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on       1951      having 08 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is  4313 out of which st -1045 sc 
-174 and oc-3027 total bpl hh is 556         the gp has 07 numbers of primary school , up-03 
and 02 numbers of high school including 09 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 62 numbers of tubewell, 26  numbers of village tank & 03  numbers of 
village pond, 02 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 51 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office  
and one ogb bank is established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-215,  
ignoap- 120   , igndp-     04  odp-  43 and ignwp -07  beneficiaries are getting pension.02  
numbers of temple are constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar 
sankranti, durga puja, laxmi puja are main festival of this gp. The main sourse of livelyhood 
is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – PADUA 

Padua  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 28  kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 28/06/1992  having 07 numbers of revenue 
villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   4745 out of which st -3104 sc 
-295 and oc-1346 total bpl hh is 637 the gp has 05 numbers of primary school , up-01 and 
02 numbers of high school including 07 numbers of awc for easy access to 



education.There are 76 numbers of tubewell, 2 numbers of village tank & 20  numbers of 
village pond, 01 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 28 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed. for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-160,  ignoap- 157   , igndp-     39  
odp-  9  and ignwp -04 beneficiaries are getting pension.01  numbers of temple are 
constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi 
puja are main festival of this gp. The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of 
villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – KASHIPAL 

Kashipal  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 19  kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1984  having 03 numbers of revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is    2615 out of which st -1828 
sc -100 and oc-687 total bpl hh is 450  the gp has 03 numbers of primary school , up-0 and 
01 numbers of high school including 05 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 48 numbers of tubewell, 5 numbers of village tank & 3  numbers of 
village pond, 01 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 29 numbers of shg 
groups have been formed.  for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office is 
established in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-108,  ignoap- 93   , igndp-     00  
odp-  13  and ignwp -101  beneficiaries are getting pension. Festival occasions: raja parva 
and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi puja are main festival of this gp.The main sourse of 
livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are depending on business during non-
agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF – BHANDA 

Bhanda  grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 21  kms far from 
the block head quarter. It was established on 1955  having 07 numbers of revenue villages.  

The total population of the gp as per 2011 censuse is   3841 out of which st -1651 sc 
-358  and oc-1832 total bpl hh is    760   the gp has 08 numbers of primary school , up-01 
and 02  numbers of high school including 06 numbers of awc for easy access to 
education.There are 62 numbers of tubewell, 14    numbers of village tank & 01 numbers of 
play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 60 numbers of shg groups have been formed. 
for financial transaction and for communication 01 post office , one ogb bank is established 
in this gp. Under social security scheme mbpy-45,  ignoap- 195   , igndp-     0  odp-  9  and 
ignwp -88 beneficiaries are getting pension. 01  numbers of temple are constructed in 
our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga puja, laxmi puja are main 
festival of this gp. The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. Some of villagers are 
depending on business during non-agricultural season.  

GP PROFILE OF - RAJIA 

Rajia grama panchayat under champua block which is situated 05 km far from the 
block head quarter. It was established on 09/02/1966 having 09 numbers of revenue 
villages. The total population of the gp  as per 2011 censuse is  8330 out of which 3985 
numbers of st house hold 736 st numbers of sc house hold and 3609 numbers of oc house 



hold are living. Total bpl hh is 1220. The gp has 15 numbers of primary school 03 numbers 
of upper primary school and 02 numbers of high school including 10 numbers of awc for 
easy access to education.There are 90 numbers of tubewell, 19 numbers of village tank & 
06 numbers of village pond, 03 numbers of play ground in this gp. For better livlyhood 65 
numbers of shg groups have been formed. for financial transaction and for communication 
01 post office is established in this gp.Under social security scheme mbpy-356, ignoap- 251     
, igndp-     02   odp-   75 and ignwp -77 beneficiaries are getting pension.03 numbers of 
temple are constructed in our gp.Festival occasions: raja parva and makar sankranti, durga 
puja, laxmi puja are main festival of this gp.The main sourse of livelyhood is agriculture. 
Some of villagers are depending on business during non-agricultural season.   

JHUMPURA BLOCK ,DISTRICT-KEONJHAR 
 

Jhumpura Block has been established on 1st October,1959 . As per 2011 census 
total population of this Block is 113293 out of which SC- 8052,ST-57144, OBC- 48097.  
There are 22GPs, 153 revenue villages, 265 wards  in this Block. Total geographical area 
of this Block is 1447.12sqkms out of which agricultural land is 245.60sqkms & irrigated land 
32.90sqkms. There are 210 nos of educational institutions out of which colleges-3, High 
schools-36, ME Schools-33, primary schools- 138. There are 1 CHC, 4nos of Addl CHCs, 
3nos of Ayurvedic dispensaries & one Homoeopathic Dispensary in this Block.There are 
179 nos of Anganwadi centres & 48 nos of Mini Anganwadi centres in this Block.There are 
1548nos of  tube wells in this Block. 

G.P. PROFILES OF JHUMPURA BLOCK  

1. Arsala G.P. :- 

 Arshala G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1992 which 
is 03  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. 
is 5694, out of the total population ST 1894  SC 407  & others 3393 and household is  
1019. There are 06  nos of revenue village consisting of 12  Wards. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 70 % of literate people are residing on 
said G.P. 

2. Asanpat G.P. :- 

 Asanpat G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 01.06.1967 which is 
18  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. is 
6644, out of the total population ST- 5100,  SC-266  & others- 678 and household is  1503. 
There are 05  nos of revenue village consisting of 12  Wards. The main source of livelihood 
of the villagers are agriculture. There are 62 % of literate people are residing on said G.P. 

3. Badadumuria G.P. :- 

 Badadumuria G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 25.03.1992  
which is 19  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 4329, out of the total population ST- 1923,  SC-485  & others- 1921 and 
household is  1008. There are 07  nos of revenue village consisting of 12  Wards. The main 



source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 63 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

4. Badaneuli G.P. :- 

 Badaneuli G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1983-84  
which is 20  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 5516, out of the total population ST- 2548,  SC-614  & others- 2354 and 
household is  1339. There are 09  nos of revenue village consisting of 12  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 65 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

5. Balibandha G.P. :- 

 Balibandha G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1954-55  
which is 12  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 7833, out of the total population ST- 4021,  SC-507  & others- 3305 and 
household is  1367. There are 10  nos of revenue village consisting of 14  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 71 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

6. Baria G.P. :- 

 Baria G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1954-55  
which is 17  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 4252, out of the total population ST- 1968,  SC-77  & others- 2207 and 
household is  1519. There are 07  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 67 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

7. Basantpur G.P. :- 

 Basantpur G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1954-55  
which is 28  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 4053, out of the total population ST- 2715,  SC-309  & others- 1229 and 
household is  1123. There are 03  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 56 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

8. Chauthia G.P. :- 

 Chauthia G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1954-55  
which is 24  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 5495, out of the total population ST- 2118,  SC-175  & others- 3202 and 
household is  1000. There are 07  nos of revenue village consisting of 13  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 62 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

 



9. Dhanurjaypur G.P. :- 

 Dhanurjaypur G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 10.03.2002  
which is 12  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 3556, out of the total population ST- 2186,  SC-153  & others- 1217 and 
household is  858. There are 04  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 66 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

10. Gumura G.P. :- 

 Gumura G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 27.06.1955  which is 
22  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. is 
3709, out of the total population ST- 2100,  SC-283  & others- 1326 and household is  712. 
There are 07  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main source of livelihood 
of the villagers are agriculture. There are 66 % of literate people are residing on said G.P. 

11. Gundunia G.P. :- 

 Gundunia G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year -2002  
which is 27  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 2705, out of the total population ST- 853,  SC-204  & others- 1648 and 
household is  754. There are 04  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 66 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

12. Jhumpura G.P. :- 

 Jhumpura G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year -1966-67  
which is 1  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the 
G.P. is 8709, out of the total population ST- 2351,  SC-642  & others- 5716 and household 
is  1284. There are 04  nos of revenue village consisting of 14  Wards. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 82 % of literate people are residing on 
said G.P. 

13. Khendra G.P. :- 

 Khendra G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 10.03.2002  which is 
05  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. is 
3500, out of the total population ST- 1160,  SC-510  & others- 1830 and household is  733. 
There are 03  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main source of livelihood 
of the villagers are agriculture. There are 78 % of literate people are residing on said G.P. 

14. Khuntapada G.P. :- 

 Khuntapada G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year-1983  
which is 10  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 6885, out of the total population ST- 2857,  SC-685  & others- 3343 and 
household is  1390. There are 07  nos of revenue village consisting of 13  Wards. The main 



source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 74 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

15. Kutugaon G.P. :- 

 Kutugaon G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 14.04.1983  which 
is 22  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. 
is 3513, out of the total population ST- 2061,  SC-459  & others- 993 and household is  
899. There are 08  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 62 % of literate people are residing on 
said G.P. 

16. Malda G.P. :- 

 Malda G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 01.06.1967  which is 
21  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. is 
5665, out of the total population ST- 4285,  SC-382  & others- 998 and household is  1077. 
There are 15  nos of revenue village consisting of 12  Wards. The main source of livelihood 
of the villagers are agriculture. There are58 % of literate people are residing on said G.P. 

17. Nahabeda G.P. :- 

 Nahabeda G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 01.06.1967  which 
is 12  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. 
is 6014, out of the total population ST- 3309,  SC-204  & others- 2501 and household is  
1851. There are 10  nos of revenue village consisting of 12  Wards. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are63 % of literate people are residing on 
said G.P. 

18. Naradpur G.P. :- 

 Naradpur G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 10.03.2002  which 
is 24  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. 
is 5029, out of the total population ST- 3267,  SC-297  & others- 1465 and household is  
885. There are 05  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are66 % of literate people are residing on 
said G.P. 

19. Nischintpur G.P. :- 

 Nischintpur G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1983-84   
which is 21  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 5911, out of the total population ST- 4125,  SC-270  & others- 1516 and 
household is  1083. There are 12  nos of revenue village consisting of 15  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are66 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

 

 



20. Nayagarh G.P. :- 

 Nayagarh G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 10.03.2002  which 
is 24  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. 
is 3391, out of the total population ST- 2526,  SC-115  & others- 750 and household is  
811. There are 06  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 56 % of literate people are residing on 
said G.P. 

21. Tukudiha G.P. :- 

 Tukudiha G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from 18.10.1981  which 
is 18  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of the G.P. 
is 6670, out of the total population ST- 2162,  SC-532  & others- 3976 and household is  
1524. There are 10  nos of revenue village consisting of 14  Wards. The main source of 
livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 72 % of literate people are residing on 
said G.P. 

22. Ukhunda G.P. :- 

 Ukhunda G.P. under Jhumpura Block is started functioning from the year 1954-55  
which is 15  Kms distance from Block headquarter. As per census-2011 the population of 
the G.P. is 4620, out of the total population ST- 1615,  SC-476  & others- 2529 and 
household is  1524. There are 06  nos of revenue village consisting of 11  Wards. The main 
source of livelihood of the villagers are agriculture. There are 78 % of literate people are 
residing on said G.P. 

BLOCK  PROFILE OF JODA BLOCK 
 

Joda Block Started functioning from 1st January 1961 as stage  one Block and from 1st april 
1962 as stage two block.  The geographically area of the Block is 264.08 sqr km. As per 
2011 census the total population of this Block is 1,25,094 out of which ST population is 
74,750 SC population is 11,610 other population 38,734. Total no of G.P. 15  no of ward is 
223 total no of revenue village  is 111.  Total cultivation area 15850 ha. Total no of primary 
school 137 High school 27, higher secondary school 1.Total no of PHC 1 , Addl PHC 2. 
Distance from district  HQ 70km. 
G.P. PROFILE OF JODA BLOCK IN A BRIEF 2015-16 

Anseikala G.P. under Joda Block is 18 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6934 out of which ST population is 4747 SC population 338 and Other 
population 1849 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 07 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 15 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 10 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 
no of High School. There are 634 nos of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 367 
Madhubabu Scheme is 267. 

Badakalimati G.P. under Joda Block is 25 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 4689 out of which ST population is 2798, SC population 599 and Other 
population 1292 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 07 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 11 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 06 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 



no of High School. There are 409 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 169 
Madhubabu Scheme is 240. 

Balada G.P. under Joda Block is 28 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6945 out of which ST population is 4407 SC population 574 and Other 
population 1964 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 05 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 14 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 09 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 
no of High School. There are 579 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 269 
Madhubabu Scheme is 310. 

Jalahari G.P. under Joda Block is 10 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 9671 out of which ST population is 4750 SC population 1666 and Other 
population 2676 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 04 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 11 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 06 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 06 
no of High School. There are 742 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 193 
Madhubabu Scheme is 549. 

Palasa G.P. under Joda Block is 18 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6752 out of which ST population is 3953 SC population 264 and other 
population 2535 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 08 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 15 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 13 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 
no of High School. There are 512 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 234 
Madhubabu Scheme is 278. 

Jajanga G.P. under Joda Block is 15 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 10578 out of which ST population is 6561 SC population 1111 and Other 
population 2906 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 06 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 14 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 07 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 
01no of High School. There are 564 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 
194 Madhubabu Scheme is 370. 

Guali G.P. under Joda Block is 24 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 10897 out of which ST population is 7253 SC population 964 and Other 
population 2680 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 13 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 16 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 14 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 
no of High School. There are 713 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 433 
Madhubabu Scheme is 280. 

Bhadrasahi G.P. under Joda Block is 05 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 11338 out of which ST population is 6099 SC population 1051 and Other 
population 4188 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 10 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 18 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 11 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 
01no of High School. There are 753 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 
257 Madhubabu Scheme is 496. 

Bhuyanroida G.P. under Joda Block is 12 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5663 out of which ST population is 4096 SC population 835 and Other 
population 732 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 03 Nos. of revenue 



Village with 13 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 06 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01no of High 
School. There are 550 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 403 Madhubabu 
Scheme is 147. 

Balagoda G.P. under Joda Block is 17 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 16335 out of which ST population is 6776 SC population 2025 and Other 
population 7534 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 06 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 25 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 07 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 
no of High School. There are 796 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 337 
Madhubabu Scheme is 459. 

Bolani G.P. under Joda Block is 18 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 7997 out of which ST population is 5331 SC population 644 and Other 
population 2022 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 09 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 18 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 14 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 
no of High School. There are 481 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 97 
Madhubabu Scheme is 384. 

Birikala G.P. under Joda Block is 07 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 9569 out of which ST population is 5730 SC population 492 and Other 
population 3347 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 08 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 15 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 13 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 01 
no of High School. There are 635 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 308 
Madhubabu Scheme is 327. 

Deojhar G.P. under Joda Block is 12 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5888 out of which ST population is 4053 SC population 181 and Other 
population 1654 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 07 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 12 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 09 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 
01no of High School. There are 455 nos of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 
261 Madhubabu Scheme is 194. 

Chamakpur G.P. under Joda Block is 18 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6794 out of which ST population is 4280 SC population 824 and Other 
population 1690 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 09 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 15 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 14 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 02 
no of High School. There are 1189 nos of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 
840 Madhubabu Scheme is 349. 

Kandara G.P. under Joda Block is 12 K.M form Block Head Quarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5678 out of which ST population is 4219 SC population 256 and Other 
population 1206 The main source of Livelihoods is Agriculture. There are 07 Nos. of 
revenue Village with 11 nos. of wards. The G.P. has 06 no of Pry./ Upper Pry. Schools 
01no of High School. There are 571 no of Pension getting person under IGNOAP/WP is 
289 Madhubabu Scheme is 282. 

 

 



        GP PROFILES OF HATADIHI BLOCK  

Aitipur GP under Hatadihi Block is 22 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 3020 (SC-495, ST-143, other-) Household-616. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 6nos of revenue villages with 13nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 5nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 13nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
6743/-. 

Anara GP under Hatadihi Block is 12 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 3237 (SC-891, ST-327, other-) Household-702. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 5nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 3nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 14nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
3550/-. 

Akarua GP under Hatadihi Block is 07 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5073(SC-3076, ST-216, other-) Household-1177. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 6nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 5nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 10nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
4500/-. 

Ambo GP under Hatadihi Block is 14 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5307 (SC-2342, ST-265, other-) Household-1294. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 8nos of revenue villages with 17nos wards and 6nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 8nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and 2nos ferry Ghat. The GP has 24nos tank and Annual 
Income is Rupees 9850/-. 

Badarampas GP under Hatadihi Block is 08 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5842 (SC-1589, ST-124, other-) Household-1371. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 8nos of revenue villages with 15nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 5nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 20nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
25,220/-. 

Balibarei GP under Hatadihi Block is 14 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 7321 (SC-1895, ST-2166, other-) Household-1560. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 4nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 5nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 18nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
6500/-. 

Bancho GP under Hatadihi Block is 08 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6352 (SC-1070, ST-772, other-) Household-1373. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 3nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 6nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 5nos of 



Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 27nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
15,220/-. 

Bangore GP under Hatadihi Block is 17 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6352 (SC-1195, ST-2235, other-) Household-1373. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 3nos of revenue villages with 14nos wards and 3nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one weekly market. The GP has 11nos tank and 
Annual Income is Rupees 7200/-. 

Danar GP under Hatadihi Block is 14 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5065 (SC-1083, ST-290, other-) Household-1198. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 4nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 4nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 51nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
12,220/-. 

Dhanurjaypur GP under Hatadihi Block is 16 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 3691 (SC-416, ST-2390, other-) Household-878. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 5nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 4nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
850/-. 

Dhenka GP under Hatadihi Block is 10 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 9206 (SC-1946, ST-3813, other-) Household-1939. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 10nos of revenue villages with 19nos wards and 8nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 9nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one daily market. The GP has 30nos tank, one weekly 
market and Annual Income is Rupees 12, 500/-. 

Gedama GP under Hatadihi Block is 14 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 3106 (SC-905, ST-319, other-) Household-678. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 5nos of revenue villages with 13nos wards and 3nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 31nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
3200/-. 

Habeleswar GP under Hatadihi Block is 16 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5180 (SC-812, ST-465, other-) Household-1044. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 7nos of revenue villages with 17nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 6nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 27nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
6500/-. 

Hadagarh GP under Hatadihi Block is 18 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5583 (SC-234, ST-4221, other-) Household-1070. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 6nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 4nos of 



Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 5nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools, one weekly market and one ferry Ghat. The GP has 2nos 
tank and Annual Income is Rupees 820/-. 

Hatadihi GP under Hatadihi Block is 01 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6186 (SC-2008, ST-1009, other-) Household-1491. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 6nos of revenue villages with 14nos wards and 7nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 6nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one college. The GP has 19nos tank and Annual 
Income is Rupees 9820/-. 

Inchol GP under Hatadihi Block is 8 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 2820 (SC-716, ST-91, other-) Household-688. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 5nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 3nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 14nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
3850/-. 

Jambhira GP under Hatadihi Block is 6 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 3975 (SC-964, ST-1144, other-) Household-844. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 4nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 3nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 12nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
1250/-. 

Kaligaon GP under Hatadihi Block is 9 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 3990 (SC-1004, ST-57, other-) Household-896. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 11nos of revenue villages with 13nos wards and 4nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 8nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 28nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
4620/-. 

K.Balipal GP under Hatadihi Block is 26 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 5118 (SC-33, ST-4541, other-) Household-962. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 7nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 4nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 8nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 10nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
3750/-. 

Mareigaon GP under Hatadihi Block is 01 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 7724 (SC-2586, ST-252, other-) Household-1782. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 12nos of revenue villages with 18nos wards and 8nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 10nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 32nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
12,250/-. 

Orali GP under Hatadihi Block is 7 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of Population 
is 4460 (SC-1641, ST-298, other-) Household-1039. The main source of lively hoods is 



agriculture. There are 4nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 4nos of Polling 
stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one weekly market. The GP has 32nos tank and 
Annual Income is Rupees 7300/-. 

Padhiaripally GP under Hatadihi Block is 18 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6647 (SC-1365, ST-2282, other-) Household-1426. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 9nos of revenue villages with 15nos wards and 6nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 8nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one weekly market. The GP has 16nos tank and 
Annual Income is Rupees 8400/-. 

Panchugochhia GP under Hatadihi Block is 12 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. 
of Population is 7632 (SC-1960, ST-32, other-) Household-1977. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 14nos of revenue villages with 22nos wards and 8nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 10nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one daily market. The GP has 11nos tank, one daily 
market and Annual Income is Rupees 7650/-. 

Pandado GP under Hatadihi Block is 4 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 4442 (SC-861, ST-1780, other-) Household-1006. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 7nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 7nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 8nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
3550/-. 

Sadanga GP under Hatadihi Block is 15 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 4860 (SC-1618, ST-166, other-) Household-1066. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 6nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 5nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one college. The GP has 53nos tank and Annual 
Income is Rupees 9820/-. 

Sadha GP under Hatadihi Block is 9 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6419 (SC-1418, ST-425, other-) Household-1424. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 8nos of revenue villages with 14nos wards and 6nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 7nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 38nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
4200/-. 

Salania GP under Hatadihi Block is 12 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 4774 (SC-1493, ST-80, other-) Household-1056. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 8nos of revenue villages with 11nos wards and 5nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 7nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one CSC. The GP has 45nos tank and Annual Income 
is Rupees 9360/-. 



Samana GP under Hatadihi Block is 18 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 7472 (SC-1165, ST-170, other-) Household-1745. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 13nos of revenue villages with 17nos wards and 9nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 12nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 45nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
3700/-. 

Sasanga GP under Hatadihi Block is 02 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 4253 (SC-1284, ST-657, other-) Household-1048. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 8nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 4nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 7nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one college. The GP has 12nos tank and Annual 
Income is Rupees 4200/-. 

Soso GP under Hatadihi Block is 12 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 6625 (SC-1753, ST-198, other-) Household-1520. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 11nos of revenue villages with 14nos wards and 7nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 8nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools and one college. The GP has 17nos tank and Annual 
Income is Rupees 1, 23,320/-. 

Sulan GP under Hatadihi Block is 06 K.m from Block headquarter. The total no. of 
Population is 2975 (SC-946, ST-218, other-) Household-764. The main source of lively 
hoods is agriculture. There are 4nos of revenue villages with 12nos wards and 4nos of 
Polling stations. The people have easy access to education and help. The GP has 4nos of 
Primary/Upper Primary Schools. The GP has 14nos tank and Annual Income is Rupees 
2500/-. 

INFORMATION OF GHASIPURA BLOCK 

The Panchayat Samiti, Ghasipura started functioning w.e.f 02-10-1955. It has 
total geographical area of - 343 Sq. Kms, Forest Area - 14586.58 Hectares with total 
population – 148231, out of which S.C – 27918, S.T – 30035, Population Density - 432 
persons per Sqr. Km., Sex Ratio – 985, Literacy Rate - 68.45, Female Literacy  - 61.45. 
It has 22 GPs, 162 revenue Villages, 332 Wards, 02 No. of Police Stations (Ghasipura & 
Ramachandrapur), 03 No. of Colleges (Batto, Sainkul & Rekutia), 27 High Schools, 83 UP 
Schools, 186 Primary Schools, 256 AWCs, 02 CHCs, 07 PHCs, 23 Sub-centers, 05 
Homeopathic Dispensary, 06 Ayurvedic Dispensary, 02 Vertenary Hospitals are present. 
Total Cultivated area of this block 21354.82 Hec. out of which 10511 Hec. The number of 
beneficiaries getting Rations under BPL – 15082, AAY – 4684, AY – 454, APL – 5293, PLO 
– 1865, RDP – 315. The number of beneficiaries getting pension under IGNOAP – 3775, 
IGNWP – 2208, IGNDP – 264 & MBPY – 6645.  This block is 85 Kms away from Keonjhar. 
Nearest Railway Station is Jajpur Road which is at a distance of 35 Kms. 

Alati GP:- Distance - 22, No. of revenue Village - 7, No. of Booth - 5, No. of Ward - 13, 
Total No. of Population - 5611, SC Population - 671, ST Population - 702, Other Population 
- 4238, Total No. of BPL - 500, Total No. of AY - 9, Total No. of AAY - 181, OAP - 78, ODP 



- 28, WP - 28, IGNOAP - 207, IGNWP - 114, Above 80 Year - 80, Total No. of Job card in 
the GP - 1145, Total No. of SHGs – 105. 

Balarampur GP:- Distance - 7, No. of revenue Village - 9, No. of Booth - 11, No. of Ward - 
21, Total No. of Population - 8662, SC Population - 1244, ST Population - 551, Other 
Population - 6867, Total No. of BPL - 918, Total No. of AY - 16, Total No. of AAY - 310, 
OAP - 506, ODP - 35, WP - 35, IGNOAP - 174, IGNWP - 131, Above 80 Year - 22, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 2059, Total No. of SHGs – 53. 

Batto GP:- Distance - 20, No. of revenue Village - 9, No. of Booth - 8, No. of Ward - 15, 
Total No. of Population - 7502, SC Population - 1561, ST Population - 36, Other Population 
- 5905, Total No. of BPL - 849, Total No. of AY - 17, Total No. of AAY - 276, OAP - 175, 
ODP - 55, WP - 55, IGNOAP - 218, IGNWP - 73, Above 80 Year - 54, Total No. of Job card 
in the GP - 1733, Total No. of SHGs – 71 

Bhandaridiha GP:- Distance - 12, No. of revenue Village - 8, No. of Booth - 9, No. of Ward 
- 20, Total No. of Population - 10296, SC Population - 1315, ST Population - 4519, Other 
Population - 4462, Total No. of BPL - 989, Total No. of AY - 17, Total No. of AAY - 309, 
OAP - 155, ODP - 67, WP - 67, IGNOAP - 213, IGNWP - 202, Above 80 Year - 16, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 2165, Total No. of SHGs – 42 

Daradipal GP:- Distance - 23, No. of revenue Village - 7, No. of Booth - 6, No. of Ward - 
14, Total No. of Population - 4537, SC Population - 1395, ST Population - 314, Other 
Population - 2828, Total No. of BPL - 485, Total No. of AY - 12, Total No. of AAY - 199, 
OAP - 154, ODP - 25, WP - 25, IGNOAP - 137, IGNWP - 134, Above 80 Year - 3, Total No. 
of Job card in the GP - 1195, Total No. of SHGs – 87 

Deogaon GP:- Distance - 11, No. of revenue Village - 7, No. of Booth - 7, No. of Ward - 13, 
Total No. of Population - 5633, SC Population - 1155, ST Population - 225, Other 
Population - 4253, Total No. of BPL - 599, Total No. of AY - 11, Total No. of AAY - 188, 
OAP - 220, ODP - 26, WP - 26, IGNOAP - 216, IGNWP - 21, Above 80 Year - 24, Total No. 
of Job card in the GP - 1269, Total No. of SHGs – 91 

Gadabandhagoda GP:- Distance - 23, No. of revenue Village - 15, No. of Booth - 8, No. of 
Ward - 17, Total No. of Population - 8280, SC Population - 1853, ST Population - 2263, 
Other Population - 4164, Total No. of BPL - 675, Total No. of AY - 10, Total No. of AAY - 
256, OAP - 145, ODP - 81, WP - 81, IGNOAP - 272, IGNWP - 1543, Above 80 Year - 12, 
Total No. of Job card in the GP - 1624, Total No. of SHGs – 61 

Ganpur GP:- Distance - 22, No. of revenue Village - 8, No. of Booth - 7, No. of Ward - 12, 
Total No. of Population - 6601, SC Population - 1769, ST Population - 2473, Other 
Population - 2359, Total No. of BPL - 551, Total No. of AY - 10, Total No. of AAY - 188, 
OAP - 119, ODP - 22, WP - 22, IGNOAP - 199, IGNWP - 152, Above 80 Year - 13, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 1264, Total No. of SHGs – 20 

Gohira GP:- Distance - 5, No. of revenue Village - 10, No. of Booth - 10, No. of Ward - 18, 
Total No. of Population - 10757, SC Population - 1283, ST Population - 6893, Other 
Population - 2581, Total No. of BPL - 1282, Total No. of AY - 17, Total No. of AAY - 325, 



OAP - 227, ODP - 40, WP - 40, IGNOAP - 234, IGNWP - 267, Above 80 Year - 24, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 2224, Total No. of SHGs – 65 

Keshadurapal GP:- Distance - 19, No. of revenue Village - 6, No. of Booth - 9, No. of Ward 
- 20, Total No. of Population - 10313, SC Population - 1833, ST Population - 3047, Other 
Population - 5433, Total No. of BPL - 1101, Total No. of AY - 11, Total No. of AAY - 319, 
OAP - 262, ODP - 54, WP - 54, IGNOAP - 152, IGNWP - 200, Above 80 Year - 32, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 2163, Total No. of SHGs – 71 

Khalana GP:- Distance - 16, No. of revenue Village - 2, No. of Booth - 4, No. of Ward - 11, 
Total No. of Population - 3985, SC Population - 593, ST Population - 29, Other Population - 
3363, Total No. of BPL - 463, Total No. of AY - 8, Total No. of AAY - 128, OAP - 100, ODP 
- 11, WP - 11, IGNOAP - 146, IGNWP - 105, Above 80 Year - 19, Total No. of Job card in 
the GP - 1012, Total No. of SHGs – 29 

Khaliamenta GP:- Distance - 8, No. of revenue Village - 8, No. of Booth - 7, No. of Ward - 
16, Total No. of Population - 6711, SC Population - 1273, ST Population - 1961, Other 
Population - 3477, Total No. of BPL - 802, Total No. of AY - 11, Total No. of AAY - 237, 
OAP - 108, ODP - 36, WP - 36, IGNOAP - 291, IGNWP - 148, Above 80 Year - 18, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 1524, Total No. of SHGs – 67 

Machhalo GP:- Distance - 11, No. of revenue Village - 3, No. of Booth - 3, No. of Ward - 
11, Total No. of Population - 2816, SC Population - 447, ST Population - 314, Other 
Population - 2055, Total No. of BPL - 312, Total No. of AY - 7, Total No. of AAY - 89, OAP - 
97, ODP - 14, WP - 14, IGNOAP - 125, IGNWP - 67, Above 80 Year - 17, Total No. of Job 
card in the GP - 693, Total No. of SHGs – 34 

Madanpur GP:- Distance - 14, No. of revenue Village - 9, No. of Booth - 9, No. of Ward - 
19, Total No. of Population - 9332, SC Population - 1711, ST Population - 1163, Other 
Population - 6458, Total No. of BPL - 1078, Total No. of AY - 14, Total No. of AAY - 282, 
OAP - 94, ODP - 22, WP - 22, IGNOAP - 356, IGNWP - 167, Above 80 Year - 43, Total No. 
of Job card in the GP - 2191, Total No. of SHGs – 85 

Pandua GP:- Distance - 17, No. of revenue Village - 4, No. of Booth - 3, No. of Ward - 12, 
Total No. of Population - 3317, SC Population - 711, ST Population - 671, Other Population 
- 1935, Total No. of BPL - 263, Total No. of AY - 7, Total No. of AAY - 104, OAP - 51, ODP 
- 7, WP - 7, IGNOAP - 135, IGNWP - 50, Above 80 Year - 18, Total No. of Job card in the 
GP - 680, Total No. of SHGs – 21 

Purunabandhagoda GP:- Distance - 25, No. of revenue Village - 2, No. of Booth - 3, No. 
of Ward - 12, Total No. of Population - 3433, SC Population - 1272, ST Population - 484, 
Other Population - 1677, Total No. of BPL - 329, Total No. of AY - 7, Total No. of AAY - 
106, OAP - 53, ODP - 21, WP - 21, IGNOAP - 133, IGNWP - 83, Above 80 Year - 29, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 705, Total No. of SHGs – 37 

Radhikadeipur GP:- Distance - 24, No. of revenue Village - 10, No. of Booth - 9, No. of 
Ward - 18, Total No. of Population - 8740, SC Population - 1711, ST Population - 2673, 
Other Population - 4356, Total No. of BPL - 1072, Total No. of AY - 10, Total No. of AAY - 



280, OAP - 351, ODP - 39, WP - 39, IGNOAP - 131, IGNWP - 62, Above 80 Year - 25, 
Total No. of Job card in the GP - 1751, Total No. of SHGs – 44 

Ramachandrapur GP:- Distance - 19, No. of revenue Village - 8, No. of Booth - 7, No. of 
Ward - 15, Total No. of Population - 7680, SC Population - 1547, ST Population - 164, 
Other Population - 5969, Total No. of BPL - 662, Total No. of AY - 13, Total No. of AAY - 
228, OAP - 193, ODP - 54, WP - 54, IGNOAP - 221, IGNWP - 65, Above 80 Year - 34, 
Total No. of Job card in the GP - 2038, Total No. of SHGs – 37 

Sainkul GP:- Distance - 13, No. of revenue Village - 2, No. of Booth - 4, No. of Ward - 14, 
Total No. of Population - 4727, SC Population - 515, ST Population - 1028, Other 
Population - 3184, Total No. of BPL - 480, Total No. of AY - 10, Total No. of AAY - 149, 
OAP - 50, ODP - 38, WP - 38, IGNOAP - 181, IGNWP - 129, Above 80 Year - 10, Total No. 
of Job card in the GP - 900, Total No. of SHGs – 40 

Saladei GP:- Distance - 28, No. of revenue Village - 9, No. of Booth - 5, No. of Ward - 13, 
Total No. of Population - 4658, SC Population - 1546, ST Population - 1, Other Population - 
3111, Total No. of BPL - 564, Total No. of AY - 9, Total No. of AAY - 159, OAP - 45, ODP - 
6, WP - 6, IGNOAP - 204, IGNWP - 157, Above 80 Year - 26, Total No. of Job card in the 
GP - 1319, Total No. of SHGs – 76 

Tarimul GP:- Distance - 16, No. of revenue Village - 4, No. of Booth - 5, No. of Ward - 13, 
Total No. of Population - 4420, SC Population - 719, ST Population - 165, Other Population 
- 3536, Total No. of BPL - 438, Total No. of AY - 9, Total No. of AAY - 147, OAP - 143, 
ODP - 17, WP - 17, IGNOAP - 162, IGNWP - 30, Above 80 Year - 18, Total No. of Job card 
in the GP - 933, Total No. of SHGs – 28 

Taruan GP:- Distance - 22, No. of revenue Village - 12, No. of Booth - 10, No. of Ward - 
15, Total No. of Population - 7150, SC Population - 1282, ST Population - 68, Other 
Population - 5800, Total No. of BPL - 670, Total No. of AY - 13, Total No. of AAY - 224, 
OAP - 103, ODP - 34, WP - 34, IGNOAP - 225, IGNWP - 165, Above 80 Year - 12, Total 
No. of Job card in the GP - 2086, Total No. of SHGs - 56 

G. P PROFILES (16 G.P) under PANCHAYAT SAMITI, ANANDAPUR 
Bailo G.P under Anandapur Block is 5 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 8520         ( ST -185 SC-4274 Others -4061). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 8 No of Revenue villages with 17 Nos of Wards and 8 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 3196.54 Acres. There is one Balabhadra Narayan Sanskrit college at village 
Tukuna. 

Baunsagarh  G.P under Anandapur Block is 6 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 8836 ( ST -5725 SC-1405 Others -1706). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 5 No of Revenue villages with 18 Nos of Wards and 7 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 5533.4 Acres. There is one SBI Mini Branch at village Baunsagarh.  



Belabahali  G.P under Anandapur Block is 10 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 6239 ( ST - 425 SC-502 Others -5312). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 3 No of Revenue villages with 14 Nos of Wards and 5 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 2019.48 Acres. There is one Commercial Bank (Bank of India, Belabahali) & one 
+2 Arts College at Belabahali namely Baleswar College. 

Dhakotha  G.P under Anandapur Block is 15 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 9008 ( ST - 4207 SC-1282 Others -3519). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 11 No of Revenue villages with 16 Nos of Wards and 8 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 4615.56 Acres. There is one Regional Bank at Dhakotha namely Odisha Gramya 
Bank, Dhakotha. 

Dhakotha  G.P under Anandapur Block is 40 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 8232 ( ST - 6657 SC-90 Others -1485). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 17 No of Revenue villages with 11 Nos of Wards and 9 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 10729.70 Acres. There is one Commercial Bank at Gayalmunda  namely Bank of 
Baroda, Gayalmunda. 

Haridapal G.P under Anandapur Block is 15 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 4452 ( ST - 254 SC-909 Others -3289). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 5 No of Revenue villages with 12 Nos of Wards and 5 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 787.19 Acres.  

Jalsuan G.P under Anandapur Block is 15 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 2580   ( ST - 202 SC-507 Others -1871). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 2 No of Revenue villages with 11 Nos of Wards and 2 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 1156.68 Acres. 

Kantipal  G.P under Anandapur Block is 10 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 7630 ( ST -3899 SC-1025 Others -2706). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 4 No of Revenue villages with 11 Nos of Wards and 7 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 4004.04 Acres. There is one +2 Arts College at Kantipal namely Kantipal College 
and one SBI mini Bank at Kantipal village. 

Kathakata G.P under Anandapur Block is 15 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 4907  ( ST - 2799 SC-527 Others -1581). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 5 No of Revenue villages with 11 Nos of Wards and 5 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 2486.46 Acres. 

Kodapada G.P under Anandapur Block is 12 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 6476  ( ST - 2831 SC-622 Others -3023). The main source of livelihood is 



cultivation. There are 8 No of Revenue villages with 13 Nos of Wards and 6 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 4399.52 Acres. There is one Commercial Bank at Kodapada namely Bank of 
India, Kodapada. 

Kolimati G.P under Anandapur Block is 20 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 9235  ( ST - 7482 SC-138 Others -1615). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 14 No of Revenue villages with 17 Nos of Wards and 11 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 11931.33 Acres.  

Manoharur G.P under Anandapur Block is 50 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 4671  ( ST - 4381 SC-151 Others -139). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 10 No of Revenue villages with 11 Nos of Wards and 4 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 7466.28 Acres.  

Panasadiha  G.P under Anandapur Block is 45 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No 
of Population 6567  ( ST - 5065 SC-74 Others -1428). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 12 No of Revenue villages with 11 Nos of Wards and 7 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 9010.11 Acres.  

Panchupalli  G.P under Anandapur Block is 8 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 5415  ( ST - 1585 SC-1153 Others -2677). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 1 No of Revenue villages with 11 Nos of Wards and 4 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 2936.86 Acres.  

Salabani  G.P under Anandapur Block is 5 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 10199 ( ST - 4459 SC-814 Others -4926). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 8 No of Revenue villages with 16 Nos of Wards and 10 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 5324.74 Acres. There is one Commercial Bank (Bank of India, Salabani) & one 
+3 Arts College at Salabani namely Salabani G.P College. 

Taratara  G.P under Anandapur Block is 10 K.M from Block headquarter. The total No of 
Population 6549 ( ST - 3012 SC-587 Others -2950). The main source of livelihood is 
cultivation. There are 10 No of Revenue villages with 12 Nos of Wards and 6 Polling 
Stations. The peoples have easy access to education and health. The geographical area of 
the G.P is 3426.84 Acres. There is one Regional Bank at Taratara namely Odisha Gramya 
Bank, Taratara. 

 

 

 

 


